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UNIT MANAGERS' MEETING AGENDA

1200 Jadwin Avenue
June 17, 2004

9a.m.—12 p.m. 200 Area Room 1C1

Project Managers or Delegates — Only Meeting (1hour)
e Review & Prioritize Issues

General (20 minutes)

Float Table

Revise and Approve TPA Quarterly Draft Presentation
IAMIT CP Work Group Status/200 Area ROD Strategy
Outstanding Action ltems

HIGH PRIORITY ACTIONS

U Plant Area Regional Closure (15 minutes)
e CDI ROD Schedule Review
— Ancillary Facilities EE/CA Schedule for Regulatory Review
e 200-UW-1 Status
— Pipelines EE/CA Schedule for Regulatory Review
— Soil Waste Sites status
— FFS/PP Status
— Drive casing/Spectra Gamma
— Status of Design Efforts/Schedule for Regulatory Review

200-TW-1, 200-TW-2, & 200-PW-5 (10 minutes)

e 200-TW-1 Confirmatory DQO and SAP Schedule
e Status of RI Report

e Status of 200-TW-1-FS and PP

e Proposed Schedule for 200-TW-2 and 200-PW-5

GROUNDWATER OPERABLE UNITS

General (5 minutes)
e Update on Well Decommissioning
- RFP Being Prepared for FY2005 Webster Type Wells

Attachment 1



' 200-BP-5 & 200-PO-1 OUs (5 minutes)
e 200-BP-5

- Sample Collection/Well List Status

- Sampling and Analysis Plan Revisions Beginning
e 200-PO-1 Status of Detailed Schedule Development

200-UP-1 OU (5 minutes)
Remediation Treatment Status
RI/FS Work Plan Status ~ Received Ecology Comments on Draft B
Started Drilling New Monitoring Well “P”
— New Monitoring Wells “K” and “R” Will Follow.
Met with Ecology June 2, 2004, to Discuss Rebound Study Option
—  Currently Preparing Operating Plan for Rebound Study

200-ZP-1 OU (5 minutes)

¢ Remediation Treatment Status

e RI/FS Work Plan Status — Final Going Through Signature Process
e DOE-RL Update on DNAPL Subcontractor Selection

e Update on Expanding Extraction Well Network to North

SOURCE OPERABLE UNITS

200-PW-1, 200-PW-3, & 200-PW-6 OUs (15 minutes)
e Schedule Review
-~ Remediation Treatment Status
— Monthly Monitoring
— Status of Field Work Preparation and Planning
— Status of Field Work at 216-Z-9

200-CW-1 & 200-CW-3 OUs (10 minutes)

e Schedule Review
— Status of FS and PP
— Current Status Spring Sampling

200-PW-2 & 200-PW-4 OUs (5 minutes)

e Schedule Review
— Status of Work Plan
- Status of RI Report

Attachment 1
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— Status of Field Planning for 216-S-7 Borehole

200-CS-1 OU (2 minutes)
¢ Schedule Review
- Status of Rl Report — Rl Report is in Review by Ecology

200-CW-5, CW-2, CW-4, & SC-1 OUs (10 minutes)
e Schedule Review

— Status of Work Plan

- Status of Rl Report

-~ Disposition of FS

— Discussion of Path Forward

200 Area Ecological Evaluation (5 minutes)
e Schedule Review

- Status of Eco DQO

— Status of Eco Evaluation Report

e Overview of Eco Activities
- Spring Sampling Progress

200-1S-1 & 200-ST-1 (5 minutes)

e Schedule Review

— Status of Work Plan — Review Issues to Resolve for October Work Plan
Submittal

— Status of ORP/RL Work on Pipeline Strategy — Status of discussions between RL
and ORP; What Interface Agreements are Needed?

200-LW-1/200-LW-2 (2 minutes)
— Status of Field Planning

200-MW-1 (2 minutes)
- Status of Field Planning

200-UR-1 (10 minutes) Schedule Review
- Status of DQO and Work Plan

200-SW-1/2 (5 minutes)
e Schedule Review
— Status on Ecology and EPA Discussions
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Attachment 3

MEETING MINUTES
200 AREA UNIT MANAGERS’ MEETING -- 200 AREA
June 17, 2004
Agenda: See Attachment #1
Attendees:  See Attachment #2
Table of Issues:
IAM ISSUES FOLLOW-ON
IT UMM MTG ISSUES AGREEMENTS ACTION
X X Points of calculation Ecology set up
meeting by 6/25
X Rod Strategy
X X 200-IS-1 OU —-RL/ORP Agreements on RL/ORP
scope (pipeline) by Oct 2004, clear meeting with
delineation of sites, TSD vs. RPP status ecology on
pipeline
proposal by July
2" (RL- Foley)
X RCRA/CERCLA Integration
200- SW-2 OU - Collaborative negotiations RL respond to
on TPA milestone, request for commitment Ecology request
within 1 week, outstanding Issues (Oct/Nov) to
(40CFR191; criteria for use of process collaborate
building) negotiations
D&D representation at UMM Lanny Dusek
already invited
U-plant tech discussion on wells RL (Thompson)
to set up
meeting by 6/25

Project Managers or Delegates — Only Meeting

e Review & Prioritize Issues — Issues were statused

Topics of Discussion:

1. General

e Float Table — The float table was handed out. It was mentioned that the float table should
be distributed the week before the UMM.

e Revised and Approved TPA Quarterly Draft Presentation — (attached)

e JAMIT CP Work Group Status/200 Area ROD Strategy — Ecology reported that they were
getting closer to discussing a strategy for grouping.

e OQutstanding Action Items — Ecology indicated that they were still looking for a clear
definition of what constitutes the Central Plateau.
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HIGH PRIORITY ACTIONS

2. U Plant Area Regional Closure

e CDI ROD Schedule Review — Incorporating last of comments from EPA, expect to have
draft complete by July 1, 2004.

— Ancillary facilities EE/CA Schedule for Regulatory Review — EPA voiced a concern
regarding obtaining approvals without formal transmittals.

e 200-UW-1 Status

— Pipelines EE/CA Schedule for Regulatory Review — Deferred to FY 2005, scope for
2005, 2006 is EE/CA and action memorandum.

— Soil Waste Sites Status

» FFS/PP Status — Have not proposed a draft schedule for draft C. Plan is to provide
the draft schedule to RL by August 11, 2004, and to EPA by August 31, 2004.

e Drive Casings/Spectral Gamma — Work is complete (39 DPTs). A borehole
summary report documenting the results will be finalized the end of September,
2004.

o Status of Design Efforts/Schedule for Regulatory Review — NPL form eliminated by
RL during review.

3. BC Cribs Area Closure

e  Confirmatory DQO and SAP — An initial strawman workbook was reviewed informally
with RL. Following incorporation of comments, it will be reviewed similarly with EPA.

e  Tc Plume Delineation — A contract was awarded to PNNL to employ advanced
geophysical characterization techniques to delineate the Tc-99/nitrate plume in the vicinity
of the 216-B-26 Trench. '

4. 200-TW-1, 200-TW-2, & 200-PW-5

e 200-TW-1 Confirmatory DQO and SAP Schedule — Meetings were held with DOE this
month. Planning to complete something in the next two to three weeks. A list of waste sites
outside of BC Cribs was requested.

e Status of RI Report — Updated STOMP modeling of the 216-T-26 waste site was provided
to EAP and USGS for review. Input is expected from USGS sometime after July 19, 2004.

e Status of 200-TW-1 FS and PP — No action at this time, put on hold. The FS is being
partitioned to separate the BC Cribs and trenches area waste sites separately. Following
issuance of a ROD for those waste sites the remainder of the waste sites will be addressed in
arevised FS and associated PP. A meeting with EPA and Ecology was requested to review
the path forward for these remaining waste sites. Ecology requested for FH to provide a
listing of wells in relation to the Focused Feasibility Study.
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GROUNDWATER OPERABLE UNITS

General

e Update on Well Decommissioning — RFP being prepared for FY 2005 Webster Type Wells
(70-100). Contract to be awarded August 2004.

200-BP-5 & 200-PO-1 OUs
e 200-BP-5
— Sample Collection/Well List Status — No discussion.

— Sampling and Analysis Plan revisions beginning — No discussion.
e 200-PO-1 Status of Detailed Schedule Development — No discussion.

200-UP-1 OU

e Remediation Treatment Status — Average Pumping Rate (counting all outage time as 0 gpm)
for CY 2004 through May 30, 2004: 49.0 gpm. Since most recent groundwater sampling
shows we are below the RAOs (Uranium 480 ppb, Tc-99 9,000 pCi/L) for all wells.
Discussions have begun with Ecology on a 6-month rebound study tentatively to begin
January 1, 2005, or sooner, with a follow-on 6-month rebound study option. Currently
preparing an “Operating Plan” to support this study. From May 10 through May 30, 2004,
the system operated between 48.2 and 53.2 gpm. Well 299-W19-39 was shutdown for 10.5
hrs between May 23 and 24 due to low water levels. System Run Time:

— For May 10-30 100.0%
— FY 2004 (Year to date) 88.8%
— System Inception to date Error in Table

e RI/FS Work Plan Draft B — Will be meeting with Ecology July 7, 2004, to discuss
comments. Important Deliverables: '

— July 12, 2005 — DOE-RL submits Draft A RI Report to Regulators
— April 5, 2007 — Issue Draft A FS Report to Regulators

e Started Drilling New Monitoring Well “P” — A problem with the subcontractor’s equipment
shut the job down due to safety concerns. New wells “K” and “R” will follow. Missing
data to support the CERCLA RI/FS process will be collected from these wells.

e Met with Ecology on June 2, 2004, to Discuss Rebound Study Option — Currently Preparing
Operating Plan for Rebound Study.

200-ZP-1 OU

e Remediation Treatment Status — Average Pumping Rate for FY 2004 through May 30:
126 gpm. From May 3 through May 30, 2004, system operated at between 153 and 212
gpm. New Extraction Well #1 is currently online. New Extraction Well #4 was online until
May 15, 2004, when a gasket failed. The recent defining of the area around Z-9 as an
asbestos control area has delayed getting new Extraction Well #4 back online. System was
shutdown for 4.5 hrs on May 10 due to high filter pressure. Preparing detailed cost and
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schedule estimates for pump-and-treat expansion. Design work will begin in early
FY 2005. System Run Time:

— For May 3 - May 30 98.9%
— FY 2004 (Year to date) 95.1%
— System Inception to date 92.4%

RI/FS Work Plan Status — Final going through signature process. Waiting for EPA to give
us their concurrence to issue Rev. 0.

DOE-RL Update on DNAPL Subcontractor Selection — No discussion.
Update on Expanding Extraction Well Network to North — No discussion.

SOURCE OPERABLE UNITS

9. 200-PW-1, 200-PW-3, and 200-PW-6 OUs

Remediation Treatment Status — 200-PW-1, system was restarted June 7, 2004, safety
concerns were addressed. Currently no air flow rate data is available. Updated system run
time data will be reported next month. The passive system remains operational. The need
to update the Operations Plan was discussed.

Monthly Monitoring — Carbon tetrachloride vapor monitoring data collected at wells and
probes May 2004 was provided along with summaries of previous monitoring results

(attached).

Status of Field Work Preparation and Planning — The Waste Control Plan for 200-PW-1,
200-PW-3, and 200-PW-6 operable units was approved on June 14, 2004.

Status of Field Work at 216-Z-9 — Drilling operations at the 216-Z-9 site have been
temporarily suspended while safety concerns are addressed.

10. 200-CW-1 & 200-CW-3 OUs

Schedule Review
— Status of FS and PP — No discussion.

—  Current Status Spring Sampling — Sampling is currently being done. DOE requested
that some of the individuals doing the sampling attend the next 200 Area UMM. 200-
CW-1 sampling was complete on June 30, 2004. Analytical analysis is underway.
Results are expected by mid-August.

11. 200-PW-2 & 200-PW-4 OUs

Schedule Review

—  Status of Work Plan — All remaining comments were resolved at a meeting held on
May 12,2004. As of June 12, 2004, the Rev.1 version was submitted for clearance
processing.

—  Status of RI Report — The Draft A version was submitted to RL on June 14, 2004, for

transmittal to the regulators by June 30, 2004, and completion of TPA milestone M-
015-43B.
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—  Status of Field Planning for 216-S-7 Borehole — Preliminary hazards classification
work is in process. A radiological evaluation is underway to determine high risk
intervals. Drilling may begin in August or September 2004. Rev. 1 of the 200-PW-2
Waste Control Plan (CP-13935) was released on June 11 as an update to add the 216-S-
7 borehole

12. 200-CS-1 OU

e Schedule Review

— Status of RI Report — Ecology currently reviewing report.
13. 200-CW-5, CW-2, CW-4, & SC-1 OUs

e Schedule Review

— Status of Work Plan — FH has completed the clearance review. RL is reviewing the
document from a Quality Assurance standpoint.

— Status of RI Report — The RI report is being routed for transmittal letter signature and
clearance review. It will be issued on or about June 30, 2004.

—~ Status of FS — No Discussion.

— Discussion of Path Forward — No Discussion.

14. 200 Area Ecological Evaluation

e Schedule Review

— Status of Eco DQO — The final draft of the DQO report and SAP were received from the
subcontractor and are undergoing final technical editing.

— Status of Eco Evaluation Report — This report is undergoing final technical editing and is
expected to be ready for issuance by June 30, 2004.

e QOverview of Eco Activities

— Spring Sampling Progress — The results of the reconnaissance survey were incorporated
into the CP Ecological SAP.

15. 200-IS-1 & 200-ST-1
e Schedule Review

— Status of Work Plan - Review Issues to resolve for October Work Plan Submittal — No
discussion.

— Status of ORP/RL Work on Pipeline Strategy, What Interface Agreements are Needed?
— No discussion.

16. 200-LW-1_/ 200-1.LW-2/200 MW-1
o Status of Field Planning — No discussion.

17. 200-MW-1
o Status of Field Planning — No discussion.
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18. 200-UR-1
e Schedule Review

— Status of DOO and Work Plan — The Draft A version of the Work Plan was delivered to
RL on June 8, 2004, three days ahead of schedule. It is currently being reviewed by RL
prior to transmittal to Ecology; in compliance with the M-13-00N milestone (June 30,
2004).

19. 200-SW-1/2
e Schedule Review

— Status on Ecology and EPA Discussions — The global issue, whether 40 CFR 191 is
relevant and appropriate as an ARAR, has not yet been resolved.
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Provide a clear definition of "Central Plateau”

FH

200 Area Unit Managers’ Meeting
OPEN ACTION ITEMS & TRACKING

EPA&Ecology

10/16/03

Attachment 4

In progress
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200 Area Unit Managers' Meeting
200 Area Remedial Action Float Table

June 2004
Task Scheduled Date Float Comments
200-CS-1
Deliver Draft A RI Report for Regulator Review 5/31/04 - Delivered 05/28/04
Deliver Draft A FS/PP for Regulator Review 11/30/05 - On schedule
200-CW-1

Regulator comments originally due
on 5/15/2003; policy level
comments received on that date;
Ecology indicated additional
comments would be coming; to date
these comments have not been
received; the new schedule date
assumes no additional comments

7/3/2003 (original date  -345-d
based on receipt of
regulator comments 45
calendar days after
Deliver Draft B FS for Regulator Review submittal (which would
be 5/15/2003) with 45
days to revise and

RqEsEe) will be received from the regulators
on Draft A
10/31/2004 (new target
date based on
collecting spring _ Om sehediie
samples and
incorporating data into
the revision)
200-LW-1
Deliver Draft A Rl Report for Regulator Review 10/31/05 - On schedule
200-PW-2
Deliver Revised Wastree :.i‘,eovr;trol Plan for regulator 3/8/04 - Delivered 02/23/04

After BCR approval, field work is

scheduled for 8/04 and completion

Ecology approve Rev 1 RI/FS work plan 2/14/03 -490-d of work is forecast to not generate a
variance for the FS. Comments

are resolved. The documentis in

Deliver Draft A Rl Report for Regulator Review 6/30/04 - On Schedule

Assumes additional sampling

Deliver Draft A FS/PP for Regulator Review 12/31/05 - necessary for Ecology request

200-SW-1/200-SW-2

Regulator DQO Interview 4/27/04 - Interview conducted on 03/17/04
Deliver Draft DQO to regulators 7/5/04 - On schedule
Deliver draft A RI/Fri :i»:ec\);k plan for regulator 12/31/04 " On/échedule
Deliver Waste Control Plan for regulator review 4/15/05 - On schedule
Start field sampling 7127/05 - On schedule
Deliver Draft A Rl Report for Regulator Review 9/19/07 - On schedule
200-TW-1
(includes 200-TW-2)
Modeling results delivered on
EPA/Ecology approve Rl Report 7/10/03 -247-d 05/21/04 to regulators
Deliver Draft A FS/PP for Regulator Review 3/31/04 - SPMNETN rg=Ea ecyn

document modification underway



200 Area Unit Managers' Meeting
200 Area Remedial Action Float Table

Task

200-UR-1
Deliver draft A RI/FS work plan for regulator
review
Deliver Waste Control Plan for regulator review
Start field sampling
Deliver Draft A Rl Report for Regulator Review

U Plant Waste Sites

Ecology approve confirmatory sampling SAP

Start U Plant Confirmatory and Design Sampling

Deliver Draft A RD/RA work plan for regulator
review (surface barrier RD/RA)
Deliver Draft A RD/RA work plan for regulator
review (excavation RD/RA)

200-1S-1/200-ST-1
Deliver Rev. 1 RI/FS work plan

Deliver Waste Control Plan for regulator review

200-PW-1/200-PW-3/200-PW-6
Deliver Rev. 0 RI/FS work plan

Deliver PW-3 Waste Control Plan for regulator
review
Deliver revised PW-1 Waste Control Plan for
regulator review

200-MW-1

Deliver Waste Control Plan for regulator review
Deliver Draft A Rl Report for Regulator Review

200-CW-5/200-CW-2/200-CW-4/200-SC-1

June 2004
Scheduled Date

6/30/04

3/1/06
4/26/06
5/14/07

12/1/03

1/5/04

1/18/05

1/18/05

10/29/04

1/24/05

3/31/04

3/29/04

3/29/04

3/26/03
12/31/05

Float

-110-d

Attachment §

Comments

On schedule

On schedule
On schedule
On schedule

Remedial decisions were not
reached with Ecology and EPA as
planned. General consensus has

just been developed and the SAP is
being finalized.
Deferred until FYO05 due to budget
constraints

On schedule

On schedule

On schedule with current
understanding of work scope. [f
scope of work expands, then
schedule will require reevaluation.
On schedule

Work Plan approved on 04/26/04

Waste Control Plans combined at
EPA's request. Delivered on
06/09/04

Delivered 03/23/04
On schedule



200 Area Unit Managers' Meeting
200 Area Remedial Action Float Table
June 2004

Task Scheduled Date Float

M-013-22 met on
schedule; Rev. 0 work
plan approved
9/28/2002.
Deliver Rev. 1 RI/FS work plan ConseRdgion TRA -347-d

change package

approved 6/5/2002.
Rev. 1 originally
scheduled to be

delivered 5/6/2003

9/1/2003 (original date
based on receipt of
regulator comments on
7/15/2003 with 45 days
for revision)

Deliver Rev. 0 RI Report -289-d

Deliver Draft A FS/PP for Regulator Review 10/31/04 -

Attachment 5

Comments

Delivered 03/22/04

Inconsistencies between the work
plan and the RI report were
identified last month. RESRAD runs
are underway to resolve the issue.
New delivery date 06/30/04

On schedule
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200 Area UMM — June 2004

200-UP-1:

e Average Pumping Rate (counting all outage time as 0 gpm) for CY04
through May 30: 49.0 gpm.

e Since most recent groundwater sampling shows we are below the RAOs
(Uranium 480 ppb, Tc-99 9,000 pCi/L) for all wells. We have begun
discussions with Ecology.on a 6 month rebound study tentatively to begin
January 1, 2005 or sooner, with an follow-on 6 month rebound study
option. Currently preparing an “Operating Plan” to support this study.

e From May 10 through May 30, the system operated between 48.2 and
53.2 gpm.

e Well 299-W19-39 was shutdown for 10.5 hrs between May 23 and 24 due
to low water levels.

¢ System Run Time

e ForMay 10 -30 100.0%
e FY2004 (Year to date) 88.8%
e System Inception to date Errorin Table

¢ RI/FS Work Plan Draft B — Will be meeting with Ecology July 7 to discuss

comments ,
e Important m & ﬁ({( 2 Hﬂt)(
> July'12, 2005 — 62546495, DOE-RL submlts Draft A Rl Report to Regulators
> April 5, 2007 — 82U53160; Issue Draft A FS Report to Regulators

e Started drilling new monitoring well “P”, but problem with subcontractor’s
equipment shut the job down due to safety concerns. New wells “K”, and
“R” will follow. Missing data to support the CERCLA RI/FS process will be

collected from these wells.

200-ZP-1:

e Average Pumping Rate for FY04 through May 30: 126 gpm

e From May 3 through May 30, the system operated at between 153 and
212 gpm.

¢ New Extraction Well #1 is currently online. New Extraction Well #4 was
online until May 15 when a gasket failed. The recent defining of the area
around Z-9 as an Asbestos control area has delayed getting new
Extraction Well #4 back online.

e System was shutdown for 4.5 hrs on May 10 due to high filter pressure.

e System Run Time -
e For May 3 - May 30 98.9%
e FY2004 (Year to date) 95.1%
e System Inception to date 92.4%
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e RI/FS Work Plan Status — Waiting for EPA to give us their concurrence to
issue Rev. 0.

200-PW-1 (200-2P-2):

System was restarted June 7 after safety concerns were addressed.
Currently no Air Flow Rate data is available.

Updated system run time data will be reported next month.

The passive system remains operational.
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299-W19-36, 299-W19-39, 299-W19-43
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Monitored at 200-PW-1 Soil Vapor Extraction Sites
FY 1998 - FY 2004

Comparison of Maximum Carbon Tetrachloride Rebound Concentrations

Attachment 7

July 2002 (2-9) or October July 2002 (2-9) or
200-PW-1 July 1998 - July 1999 - July 2001 - July 2002 - 2003 (Z-1A) - April 2004 (Z-1A) -
{200-2P-2) September 1999 June 2001 June 2002 September 2003 March 2004 May 2004

Location Site | Maximum Rebound | months*| Maximum Rebound | months'] Maximum Rebound | months*] Maximum Rebound | months*] Maximum Rebound | months*] Maximum Rebound | months
(Well or Probe) Carbon Tetrachlonde of _[Carbon Tetrachioride] of | Carbon Tetrachlofide of Carbon Tetrachloride! of Carbon Tetrachioride! of ] Carbon Tetrachloride of
Ifeet bgs = (Ppmv) rebound (ppmv) rebound (ppmy) rebound| (opmv) rebound (ppmv) rebound| (ppmv) rebound|
79-0% 5 ft 2-18 0 12
79-06/5 ft Z1A 14 12
79-11/5ft Z-1A 29 12
88-05/ 5 ft 2-9 0 3
186-05-01/ 5 ft 29 o] 3
[85-06/5 t Z-9 19] 6
|87-05/5 1t ZA 0] 12
187-09/5 #t Z-1A 26] 12
94-02/ 5 ft 2- .4 3
95-11/51t Z- 25 €
95-12/5 ft Z- 13 €
95-14/5 ft Zs 0
CPT-13A/ 9 ft Z-1A 1.0] 12
[CPT-16/ 101t z 5
CPT-17/ 101t -9 5.1 .6 24 3.2 6 6.6/ 15 9.0 21 99 23
CPT-18/15ft 2-9 5.0 .2 24 14 6 24 15 2.4 21 2’5 23
CPT-4A/ 25 ft Z-1A not measured .5 0 34 10
CPT-4E/25ft Z-1A not measured not measured 26| 12 1.3 0 1.7] 0
CPT-16/ 25 ft 2-9 not measured s 24 1.1 6 2 15 26 21 26 23
CPT-31/25ft Z-1A 0 12 |
CPT-32/251 Z-1A 10 12 1651 18 13.0 12 8.3 6 6 6
CPT-30/ 28 ft Z-18 32 12 14 18 0 12 0 6 0 6
CPT-13A/ 30 ft Z-1A not measured 3.6 18 26 12 1.6l (<] 2 6 0
CPT-7A/ 32ft Z-1A 54 12 6.2 18 56 12 3.9l 6 95 6 0
CPT-27/33ft Z-9 not measured 26 24 1.5 6 1.7 15 2. 21 . 23
CPT-1A/35 1t Z-12 3.0 12 7.7 18 11.3] 12 220 15 18.3] 6 10.7 0
CPT.28/40 ft 2-9 565 6
CPT-3% 40 ft ZA 2.6 12 23 12
CPT-34/40 ft Z-18 1.7 12 1.9 0 22 12 1.6 ] 1.4 0
CPT-21A/ 45 ft Z-9 57 3 127, 24 133 6 s00l 15 150 21 150 23
W15-220ST/52 ft | 2 16 3 25 24 1.51 1
CPT-28/ 60 ft 2- 37 3
CPT-9A/ B0 ft Z9 44 3 68 24 45.3 6 359 15 359 21 359 23
CPT-16/65 ft Z9 not measured not measured not measured; 42 15 40/ 23
CPT-1A/ 68 ft 2-12 not measured not measured 55 12
CPT-30/ 68 ft Z-18 3.0 12
CPT-32/70ft Z-1A 77 12
CPT-13A/ 70 ft Z-1A 56 12
CPT-24/70 ft Z-9 3.6 3 47 15 44 23
N15-219SST/70ff Z-9 7.6 3 78 24 1.9 1 9.5 22
CPT-18/75ft Z-9 not measured 18 24 45 15 8.0 23
CPT-4A/ 75 ft Z-1A not measured not measured 71 3
CPT-31/76 ft Z-1A 4.2 12
CPT-3¥ 80ft Z-1A 9.2 12
wW15-82/83 ft 2-9 46 6 55 24 66.7 6 85.8 15 85.8 21 85.8 23
CPT-21A/ B6 ft Z2-9 148 6 195 24 186 6 206 15 244 21 244 23
CPT-34/ 86 ft Z-18 0 12
W15-95U/ 86 ft 2-9 39 6 43| 21
W15-218SST/86 fff 2-9 0 3 1.6 2
CPT-28/ 87 ft 29 203 8 224 24 229 6 235] 15 258 21 258 23
CPT-48/90 ft Z1A 3.2 10
CPT-1A/91 ft Z-18 4.2 12 10.7 10
CPT-4A/ 91 ft Z1A 14 12 7.5 2
CPT-9A/ 91 ft Z2-9 72 3 743 6
W15-85/ 91 ft Z9 not measured 51 24
W18-252SST/ 100 | Z2-1A 24 12
W18-152/ 101 ft Z-12 33 12 25 18 257 12 20.7 (<] 124 6
CPT-4E/ 103 ft Z-1A not measured not measured| 16.1 12
W18-167/ 106 ft Z-1A 228 12 248 18 297 12 243 (<] 266 6
W18-165/ 109 ft Z-1A not measured not measured 278 12 328 (<] 205] 6
W15.217/ 114 ft Z9 561 6 442 24 93.6 6 444] 15 458 21 458 23
CPT-24/ 118 ft Z-9 37 6 35 24 278] 15 15.3 23
W15-220S8ST/ 118! Z-9 38 3 4| 24 275 3 260] 23
W18-158L/ 120 R | 2-1A 492 12 284 8 163 3
W15-219SST/ 130| 2-9 47 3 54 24 2311 il 57 22
W18-249/ 130 ft Z-18 215 12 176/ 18 196 12 48.3 (<] 41.0 6
W18-248/ 131 ft Z-1A 177 12 214 18 306] 12 182 6 180 6
W15-95L/ 144 ft Z-9 not measured not measured. 31.8 6 251 15 403 21 403 23
W15-219SS7/ 1551 Z2-9 24 3 44 24 6.8 1 0 22
W15-220L 163 ft | 2-9 e 15 8l 23
W15-219U/ 1751t | Z-9 == 15 23 23
W15-9U/ 176 ft Z-9 15 6 20 21 16.9 6 131 15 13.1 21 13.1 23
W15-84L/ 180 ft 2-9 not measured not measured. not measure_al 259 15 259 21 259 23
W15-6L/ 182 ft 2-9 136
W15-220SST/ 185| 2-9 13] 3 15 24 — 1
W18-7/197 ft Z-1A 29| 12
W18-12/198 1| 2-18 18] 12
W18-6U 208 ft Z2-1A 15| 12
— — | ki | |
=, | |*-based onlocation (Z-1A/18/12 or Z-9) of monioring point, W“'."SP?"‘".M“_'“!W‘" SVE zone of influence during part operati i B e N
™ = | -218.and Z.12 wells offine Oct 96 - Agr 98 N i I _| el | —
ol - CPT.1A, CPT-9A, andpossibly CPT-7A appeared to be beyond SVE zone of influence in Oct 96 based on differential pressure (BHI-01105,p.6-1) i

- CPT-9A, CPY-21A_ CPT-23 bevond SVE zone of influence in May 96 based on CCl4 concentalions and aiflow modeling based on measured vacuums gEHI-DHO‘i p'&()




Carbon Tetrachloride Rebound Concentrations
Monitored at 200-PW-1 Soil Vapor Extraction Sites
July 2002 (Z-9) or April 2004 (Z2-1A) - May 2004

Attachment 7

200-PW-1
(200-ZP-2) 05/01/2003 | 05/22/2003 | 07/01/2003 | 08/05/2003 | 08/26/2003 | 10/31/2003 | 12/04/2003 | 12/22/2003 | 01/20/2004 | 02/19/2004 | 03/16/2004 03/24/2004 | 04/29/2004 05/05/2004 | 06/03/2004
Location Site
(Well or Probe) CCl4 CCl4 CCl4 CCl4 CCl4 CCl4 CCl4 CCl4 CCl4 CCl4 CCl4 CCl4 CCl4 CcCu4 CCl4
Neet bgs (ppmv) (ppmv) (ppmv) (ppmv) (ppmv) (ppmv) (ppmv) (ppmv) (ppmv) (ppmv) (ppmv) (ppmv) (ppmv) (ppmv) (ppmv)

CPT-17/ 10 ft 2-9 53 6.6 4.5 6.1 5.3 3.2 4.1 2.7 5.8 5.0 — (c) 9.0 7.0 9.9
CPT-18/ 15 ft Z-9 0 2.0 0 1.8 24 0 1.1 1.0 1.5. 14 —(c) 1.6 12 2.5]
CPT-4E/ 25 ft Z-1A 1.7 1.4
CPT-16/ 25 ft Z-9 1.0 0 12 1.5 1.5 2.6 1.2 14 0 1.7 2.2 1.8 14
CPT-32/ 25 ft Z-1A 0 0 0 24 5.1 5.9 ]
CPT-30/ 28 ft Z-1A 0 0 0 0 0 0
CPT-13A/ 30 ft Z-1A 0 0 0 0 0 1.8 1.4 1.5
CPT-TA/ 32t _ Z-1A 2.4 3.0 2.7 43 3.0 9.5 1.7 1.9
CPT-27/33 ft Z-9 1.0 7 1.1 1.0 1.6 1 0 11 1.5 20 27 25 14
CPT-1A/35ft | Zz-12] = 18.3 9.5 13.1 10.8 6.0 9.0 4.2 10.7
CPT-34/ 40 ft 2-18 14 1.1
CPT-21A/ 45 ft 2-9 72.8 90.0 i751 85.5 83.0 523 89.1 68.5 59.2 71.8 —(c) 150 59.2 136
CPT-9A/ 60 ft Z-9 30.1 33.2 30.1 30.0 28.5 25.9 33.1 30.8 243 33.8 271 255 28.3
CPT-16/ 65 ft 2-9 39 4.0
CPT-24/70 ft 2-9 4.4 4.4
W15-219SST/ 70 ft 2-9 9.5
CPT-18/ 75 ft Z-9 8.0 6.2
W15-82/ 83 ft Z-9 50.0 56.2 49.2 443 54.4 24.0 344 43.1 47.5 45.9 50.5 83.1 0
CPT-21A/ 86 ft Z-9 199 206 153 187 197 91.8 183 171 244 98.1 — (c) 212 733 177
CPT-28/ 87 ft 2-9 178 235 150 197 190 155 206 140 56.7 96.1 —(c) 258 26.8 222
W18-152/ 101 ft Z-12 57 10.5 11.3 10.5 12.4 124
W18-167/ 106 ft Z-1A 201 223 201 266 201 — (b)
W18-165/ 109 ft Z-1A 94.2 205 193 188 186 94.8
W15-217/ 114 ft 2-9 74.3 409 89.7 335 444 53.8 80.4 66.4 82.5 62.0 —(c) 458 256 377
CPT-24/ 118 ft Z-9 5.3 15.3
W15-220SST/ 118 ft | 2-9 26.0 18.7
W18-249/ 130 ft 2-18 8.0 31.1 21.4 19.6 2241 41.0
W15-219SST/ 130 ft Z-9 5.7
W18-248/ 131 ft Z-1A 78.6 80.4 85.6 90.9 166 180
W15-95L/ 144 ft 29 17.2 18.8 25.1 137 10.9 19.2 20.3 —(a) —(a) 40.3 23.0 35.0 22.0
W 15-219SST/ 155 ft Z-9 0
W15-220L/ 163 ft Z-9 7.5 6.4
W15-219L/ 175 ft 2-9 —(d) 23.0 2.9
W15-9L/ 176 ft Z-9 8.2 11.6 10.3 13.1 12.5 6.1 5.8 — (a) —(a) 9.1 9.6 8.8 10.1
W15-84L/ 180 ft 2-9 8.3 25.9 1_7.9 21.0 23.8 4.7 4.9 4.9 10.7 18.5 — (c) 19.5 15.6 16.4

(a) Unable to access because of drilling operations

(b) Unable to sample; tubing will be repaired.

(c) anomalously low due to pump problems; resampled on 3/24/04

(d) unable to install sample tubing; sampled W15-219SST/70 ft, W15-219SST/130 ft, and W15-219SST/155 ft instead
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GROUNDWATER REMEDIATION PROJECT

GROUNDWATER REMEDIATION PROJECT
FY 2004 TPA MILESTONE SUMMARY

(Major & Interim Milestones)

Attachment 8

Status as of: March 31, 2004

Completed Forecast
s : Compliance Forecast/ :
PBS Milestone Title Ahead On Ahead On Behind
Date Actual Date | gchedule | Schedule | Schedule | Schedule | Schedule
Complete required well installations in accordance with RCRA and X
M-024-57A | CERCLA groundwater requirements. Install a minimum of 15 wells by 12/31/03 12/31/03
12/31/03.
Submit 200-TW-1 & TW-2 OU FS and PP including Past Practice
MROISHHID Waste Sites in 200-PW-5 Fission Product-Rich Process Waste Group SR Ly S
M-015-39B | Submit 200-CS-1 Chemical Sewer Group RI Report 5/31/04 5/31/04 X
M-013-00N Submit 1 200 NPL RI/FS (RFI/CMS) Work Plan for the 200-UR-1 X
Unplanned Releases 6/30/04 6/30/04
Submit 200-PW-2 OU RI Report including Past Practice Waste Sites in
M-015-43B | 1 ¢ 200-PW-4 General Process Waste Group e WY %
M-024-57B | DOE Initiates Discussions Annually to Reaffirm Selected Wells 6/30/04 6/30/04 X
M-024-57C | Conclude Negotiations & Revise M-024-57 8/1/04 8/1/04 X
Initiate Intermediate Design and Authorization Safety Analysis for
M-016-66 | pemedial Actions (618-10/11) CEL s Note 1

DRAFT TPA Quarterly Review (1/04 — 3/04)
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ACCOMPLISHMENTS

200 Area Waste Site Remediation

The feasibility study and proposed plan for the 200-
TW-1, 200-TW-2, and 200-PW-5 Operable Units
(OU) were transmitted to the regulators on March
31, 2004 for their review in accordance with the
TPA. The transmittal of these documents fulfills
interim TPA Milestone M-015-41C. These
documents are the decision documents for 79
waste sites, including 28 waste sites in the BC
Cribs and Trenches area.

The U Plant Waste Sites Draft Proposed Plan was
modified to reflect comments received from EPA
Region 10. On February 9, 2004, a half day
workshop was held with EPA and Ecology to brief
them on the comment resolutions and the revised
proposed plan. A copy of the revised proposed
plan was provided prior to the work shop.
Remaining issues include RCRA/CERCLA
integration and evaluating a new alterative, e.g.
excavation and capping option.

The 200-PW-1, 200-PW-3, and 200-PW-6 Operable
Unit (OU) Grouping field investigation is in
progress. Drilling continued at the 216-Z-9 Trench.

The Rev.0 Work Plan for 200-PW-1, 200-PW-3, and
200-PW-6 OU’s (plutonium and organic-rich) is
complete and will be submitted to EPA for review in
accordance with the TPA. EPA stated that
additional comments will be minimal, if any, and
could be addressed through the approval letter.

The 200-CW-5, 200-CW-2, 200-CW-4, and
200-SC-1 Rev. 1 consolidated work plan forthese
OUs is being finalized for transmittal to DOE/RL
and the regulators in April 2004. Comments were
received on the OU Remedial Investigation (RI)
Report from the regulators and comment resolution
was finalized in December 2003. :

Progress continues on development of the data
quality objectives (DQO) to support completion of
the 200 Area NPL site ecological risk assessment
needs. A workshop was held on March 30, 2004
with the Parties, and participants from the HNRTC
and the HAB River & Plateau Committee to discuss
the draft DQO summary report.

A series of collaborative meetings was held with
Ecology and DOE/RL participants concerning the
development of the 200-SW-1 and 200-SW-2 RI/FS
Work Plan. Issues discussed include 40 CFR 191
as an applicable or relevant and appropriate
requirement for these OUs and the use of process
knowledge. The DQO for this work plan is

underway. The work plan is due December 31, 2004
under Tri-Party Agreement milestone M-013-000.

Groundwater Remediation

Draft B RI/FS work plan for the 200-UP-1 operable
unit is being reviewed by Ecology. The title of this
report is Remedial Investigation /Feasibility Study
Work Plan for the 200-UP-1 Groundwater Operable
Unit, DOE-RL-92-76.

EPA and DOE/RL comments were received on the
Remedial Investigation/Feasibility Study Work Plan
for the 200-ZP-1 Groundwater Operable Unit,
DOE/RL-2003-55 and the comments are currently
being incorporated.

The three 100 Area pump-and-treat systems (100-
KR-4, 100-NR-2 and 100-HR-3) and the 200-ZP-1

OU are all operating above 90% availability for FY 04.
For the 200-ZP-1 OU, replacements for current
extraction wells 1 and 4 have been installed and will
be connected to the treatment system in April 2004.

Three extraction wells are currently pumping within
the 200-UP-1 OU. Due to technical difficulties during
the first quarter of FY04, the 200-UP-1 pump-and-
treat system is currently showing 84% availability
through the end of the second quarter of FY04. The
200-UP-1 OU is pumping >50gpm throughout the
remainder of the year to ensure that a 50 gpm
average, as required by the interim action record of
decision, is achieved at the end of CY 2004.

Vapor extraction at Trench T-04 in the 218-W-4C
Burial Ground continued.

As of March 31, 2004 2 wells have been completed
and accepted, drilling and completion of another 11
wells is underway for FY 2004.

A total of 99 wells were decommissioned as of March
2004.

The DQO Process was initiated in October for the
evaluation of impacts at 100 N to aquatic and riparian
ecoreceptors. The schedule for the DQO and SAP
was revised so that seasonal sampling could be
included. The final report will be issued in October,
2005 rather than October 2004 as previously
planned. The revised schedule will also allow better
coordination with the River Corridor Risk Assessment
so that appropriate sample media are collected for
both assessments.

DRAFT TPA Quarterly Review (1/04 — 3/04)
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Initial laboratory work supporting the 100-NR-2
strontium-90 (Sr-90) treatment options
(phytoremediation and apatite-sequestration) began
during the second quarter of FY 2004. Core
samples were collected during drilling of a new
monitoring well near the center of the former N
springs. The core samples will be used to help
assess Sr-90 mobility and extraction efficiency
based on site-specific media properties.

Work continued on remedial actions to address an
additional area of chromium contaminated
groundwater in the 100 D Area. During the second
quarter of FY 2004, over 75% of the water lines in
the 100 D area were cut and capped, thus
eliminating this potential driver. Plans to extend the
ISRM were deferred until the causes of the
apparent reduction in barrier longevity are better
understood. A targeted pump and treat system was
selected for the near term to minimize the impact of
contaminated groundwater on the river and to
achieve mass reduction of hexavalent chromium.
Design of the extraction and injection network and
associated treatment system has begun. Startup of
an initial 40 -50 gpm system is scheduled for July
2004. Bechtel is preparing a test plan for
investigation suspected soil contamination source
areas.

A focus group of outside experts was assembled to
evaluate possible causes of the ISRM breakdown
and to make recommendations for a mitigation plan.
The group met at Hanford on March 2™, 3™ and 4™.
Additional characterization of the barrier is
anticipated as result of the focus group report
expected in April 2004.

ISSUES

U Plant Soil Waste Sites

Issue- The characterization and remediation
planning approach for pipelines in the U Plant area
is not progressing at a pace that is satisfactory to
the regulators due to primarily budgetary
constraints.

Status- RL and ORP are jointly working on
characterization and remediation criteria for central
plateau pipelines. They last provided status
information to the IAMIT in March of 2004. The
scope division between RL and ORP is the subject
of ongoing discussions between the two
organizations, and is also the focus of the IAMIT
Central Plateau closure strategy working group

200-PW-2 and 200-PW-4 Work Plan Approval

Issue- Outstanding comments on the 200-PW-2 and
200-PW-4 Operable Units Work Plan remain
unresolved. These comments include the needfora
borehole in a hexone waste site.

Status- A comment resolution meeting was held with
Ecology on February 23, 2004. The remaining
comments were discussed and Ecology was provided
redline copies of the text revisions. Ecology also
raised the issue of RCRA/CERCLA integration and
offered to revise work plan text on that issue. Input
from Ecology on the RCRA/CERCLA integration text
or comments on the redline text of the comment
incorporation has not been received by DOE/RL.

Planning is underway to drill a borehole in the 216-S-
7 Crib in response to Ecology’s comment on the need
to characterize a hexone waste site. Atthe
November Unit Manager Meeting Ecology stated that
the additional characterization data could be included
in the Feasibility Study which follows the RI report so
the associated FY04 and FY05 TPA

milestones should not be negatively impacted.

Draft B Revision of the 200-CW-1, 200-CW-3, and
other 200 North Waste Sites Feasibility Study and
Proposed Plan

Issue- EPA & Ecology transmitted a comment letter
that identified a number of “global issues” but did not
include detailed technical comments. The Parties
continue to address the issues.

Status- The remedial actions were re-packaged as a
result of the issue resolution activities. Fall ecological
sampling was conducted to resolve concerns over the
potential presence of new-to-science species at the
waste sites. Additional ecological sampling is
planned for this spring to help resolve the
contaminants that were identified in the ecological
risk assessment in the feasibility study as
representing marginal ecological risks. The data from
these sampling events will be available in August,
2004, and will be incorporated into Draft B of the FS
and proposed plan. The proposed plan will be
migrated to the new format developed as part of the
U Plant Waste Site Project. A revision of the
feasibility study and proposed plan will be prepared
for delivery to the regulators in October 2004.
Ecology indicated at the February UMM that this FS
is not a high priority, given the other FSs currently in
process.

DRAFT TPA Quarterly Review (1/04 — 3/04)
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200-IS-1 and 200-ST-1 Work Plan Approval

Issue-Ecology has requested that the pits, lines,
tanks, and boxes (200-1S-1) and septic tanks (200-
ST-1) work plan be revised to include additional
information on “likely response scenarios and
potentially applicable technologies and operable
units that may address site problems.” This would
require a revision to the Rev. 0 document.

Status- USDOE is preparing a Revision 1 work
plan. One unresolved issue is the interface
between RL and ORP; the latter has programmatic
responsibility for some waste sites included in these
operable units that are not addressed by the work
plan. ORP and the IAMIT Central Plateau work
group are looking at the latter issue.

200-TW-1, 200-TW-2, and 200-PW-5 RI Report
Approval

Issue — The regulators provided comments in a
letter dated March 2, 2004, concerning the fate and
transport modeling performed for the representative
waste sites. The regulators provided conditional
approval of the Rl Report pending resolution of the
modeling comments.

Status — A meeting with the regulators, USDOE,
and USGS representatives was held on March 17,
2004 to discuss the comments and identify a path
forward for revising the documents. The USGS
provided clarification on the comment concerning
Monte Carlo simulations by stating they are really
interested in_sensitivity analysis and not actual
Monte Carlo simulations. RL will prepare some
modifications to the modeling strategy and present
them for discussion to USGS and the regulators.
Once the strategy is agreed to, USDOE will rerun
the modeling and present the information in the RI
Report revision. This is expected to be done by
July, 2004.

DRAFT TPA Quarterly Review (1/04 — 3/04)
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Status as of: March-31, 2004

200-PW-2

05u

Oss

(Note 2)
imit 200-PW-2 OU RI Repol

t Induding Past Practice W
( )Submit 200-PW-2

OU FS/PP/Proposed RCRA

te Sites In 200-PW-4

REMEDIATION PROJECT Updated April 13, 2004 11:45 Am
. ———E 1| 2002 | _EEFQ 12003 ] .___FB_s_ci _Es%l_zgﬂi__ __ELSSE_I_ZQQ_G__ Fl Fiscal 200 iscal 20 F 10
Operable Unlt—zrﬁfﬂ%—ﬁlé%ﬂ[—— uarter __rg__]lLﬂe_[f___ uarter By Quarter By Do ’e'ra E&c uart%?__’ a?ter
ist [ 2nd| 3rd [4th [ 1st [2nd [3rd T4th | Tst ndl 3rd T4th | 1st1 2nd] 3rd [ 4th | 1st] 2nd[ 3rd | 4th | 1st] 2nd] 3rd | 4th t 2n T th [2nd] h
200 Area ! Note 1 - Ecology biieves this Is at risk"
. . 1 ote 1 - “Ecology ves this Is at ris!
Remedial Action ) Note 2 - “Ecology bgzves these are at risk due|to unresolved comment on
M-_t:i:o_o.LiznﬁLOJ}(A) ! sampling plan”
200 AreaWork Plans Submit 3 200 NAL RIFS (RFIICMS) Wark Plans :
-2 1 1
Submit Plutonium|/ Organic-Rich Pmcess Wagte Group (20P-PW -1) World Plan
m Submit 1 200 NAL RIFS (RFUFMS) Work Pfan for 2004S-1 OU, IncludtJF waste sites in 200-ST-1
I amﬂ_; -00N (Date revised from 12{31/03 per TPACC M-13-01| approved by RL 10/23/03)
: & ubmit 1 200 NPL RIFS (RF S) Work Plan for 200-UR4{! OU
i 4 M-13-000 (Note 1
! Submit 1 200 NPl RI/FS (RFI/CMS) Work Plgn for 200-SW-2 OU, Includds waste sites in 200-SW-1
200 Area Assessmerijts M-15-384 {6/23/02{A) !
200-CW-1 Submit 2occw-1FS/PP}:mposed RC[RA Permit Mod for Gable Mfn Pond/B Pond & Ditch Codjing Waste Group ....
200-CW-§ M-15408 0530/02(A)
200-LW-1 Submit 200-CW-SU Pond /Z Ditches Cooling Watsr Group [RI Report Including Past Prfictice Waste Sites in 200-C|V-2, 200-CW-4 & 200-SC-1
200-MW-1 I (Wm.«];iﬂg
} ~“Submit 200-CW-S FS/PPjfor U Pond / Z Ditches Coollng Water Group , Including|Past Practice Waste Sites iff 200-CW-2, 200-CW-4, & 20-SC-1
1 L/
: ( | )Submil 200 Area Chemical Lab Waste OUs Ri Rfport
I Submit 200-MwW-1|OU RI Report
I G) M-15-468
; Submit 200 Area Chemigal Lab Waste OUs FS
! ®MJ§£B
I Submit 200-MW-{ FS & Proposed Plan
200-CS-1 . Complete gemxnl Sewper Group field Work Through Sample Collection & Analyksis
Submlt 2 ?0 CS-1 Chemical Sewer Gjoup R! Report
: ®M-15§g§
H Submit 200-CS-1 FS/PP/Proposed RCRA Permit Hod for Chemical Sewer Gralip
| M-15418 10/23/02(A) !
200-TW-1/200-TW-2 Submit200-TW-1 & 20[-TW-2 OU RI Report 1o Repulators, Including Past Prattice Waste Sites in 200-PW-5
M-1541C |
Submit 204-TW-1 & 200-TW-2 OU FS/Proposed Plan to Regulatarg, induding 200-PW-5

Permit Mod Induding Past Practice Waste Sites in 200 |PW-4

iSubmn Closure/P

216-A-10.|216-A-36B, 216-A-37-1, 20f-A South Retention Basin
216-S-10 Pond, 216-S-10 Ditch, 341-§X-71, and 241-CX-72

pst Closure Plans for

200 Area Commpn mit PP to Reéutatas to Cofiduct RA for Source Controlfat High-RIsk Waste Sites Which includes an Englneeriffg Evaluation of an Enginegjred Surface Barrier
: 1590
] Complete RIFS (lar RFI/CMS) Process for
ith
: ll.-ii:n!)_a All Operable Unit
i Complete All 204 Area Non-Tank Farm OU
"""""" = T i 1 i # Pre-ROD Site Infestigations Under
200 Area Closure Plans ! :DSubmit 216-5-10 PondDitch Closure/ Post Closurd Planto Ecology In Coord AgprovedWorctiagiSchedutes
i
200-CS-1 H ith / FS for 200-CS-1 fVb coord under M-15-39C)
! s M-20-54
200-PW-2 : Submit 216-A-10, $16-A-368, 216-A-37-1 Qb & 207-A South (1)submi 314-cx-74 71,72 Tanke Clomra
1 Retention Basin qmurdet Closure Plan o Ecology in Coord Post Closure Plan}o Ecol in Coord w/ 200_.5_
200-1S-1 1 w/FS for 200-PW-3 (tb coord under M-1543C]| FS Scheduled under M-13-00M
' :
i
1
k.

%Ma[or Milestone @lnlaﬁm Mitesione O Forecast

mo Complete @ Unrecoverable

@ “At Risk*

(P) Pending Change Request

O RCRA Permit Commitment



GROUNDWATER

REMEDIATION PROJECT

TPA Milestone Summary Schedule

Attachment 8

Status as of: March.31, 2034

Updated April 13, 2004 11:45 Am

618-10/618-11
Burial Grounds

Els%gl 2003 F|§§(§l 2004 Fi§g(al 2005 Fiscal 2 E!s_gg] 2007 Fiscal 2008 Fiscal 20 ][Egiig: fg1$
uarter y Quarter y Quarter Yy Quarter y Quarter uarter =] uarter uarter uarter
1st [ 2nd[3rd [4th_ | 1st [2nd [3rd_[4th | 1st ] 2nd| 3rd [4th_|_1st] 2nd[ 3rd [ 4th | 1st1 2nd[ 3rd [ 4th | _1st %ndl 3rd [ath | 1st %ﬁl—?'ra‘ Ath | st F%IFH] 3rd_[4th [ st ] 2nd [ 3rd [ 41

(: )M-1 6-66
Inititate intermediate desi

in and ASA for Remedial Adtions
| M-16-67
Submit intejmediate Design, Report, Sdhedule, and Treatability inv \Work Plan
I Groundwater
-24-51 thi 5 t
-24-51 1, M-24-52 09/29/01(A), M-24-54 1 1 M-24-. 1 (A
Common Install 11 Monitoring{Wells at SST WMA B-BX-BY, U, S-§X, T-TX-TY
M-24-00M 11/08/01 {A) 1
install RCRA Grouridwater Monitoring Wells at Rate from 0 14 50 in CY 2000 (i required)
om:zg;suzum& !
Install 2 Monitoringd Wells at SSTIWMA TX-TY
m -24-00N 12/18/02 (A) t
Install RCRA Groundwater Moni‘ming Wells a{ Rate from 0 to 50 in CY 2092 (if required)
0M-24-§7A 12/31/03 {A)
DOQ Shall Install § minimum of 15 Wells by 14/31/03
1 -24-578
: (DE%LO%E Initiates discussions Annudly to Reaffirn Selected Wels
1 L-24-§7Q
: ( )Condude Negotiations & Revise M-24-57 by 08/01/04
1 =
: @ DOE Shall Install § Cumulative of 30 Wells by| 12/31/04
1
: Initiates discussions Annudly to Reaffirn Selected Wells
1 g
: Conclude Negotiations & R4vise M-24-57 by 08/01/05
] o
: ( ) DOE Shall install p Cumulative of 45 Wells by] 12/31/05
] K
: OF Initiates discussions Annugly to Reaftirm Selected Wels
! B |
1 @ Canclude Negotiations & Revise M-24-57 by 08/01/06 |
1 @&m |
: DOE Shall Install § Cumulative of 60 Wells by|12/31/06 .
' A
: - Complete Well injjtallations with RCRA/CER(LA Groundwater Requirem¢nts
M-16-27B 11/20/01 {A) 1
100-HR-3 @ Complete 100-HR-3 Phase i, ISRM Barrier Emplacement :

2

b 1 —

M-16-
Complete 10D-HR-3 Phasd lll, ISRM Barrier Emplaceny

ent

“Ma[or Milestone @Inlaﬂm Milestone 0 Foracast

mo Complete @ Unrecoverable

@ *At Risk"

(P) Pending Chenge Request

O RCRA Permit Commitment



GROUNDWATER REMEDIATION PROJECT

Attachment 8

Groundwater Remediation Project

TPA Milestone Statistics

(Major & Interim Miiestones)

“2M-24-00/57 Mocdified by

-02 Approved March 01, 2004

250 ¢
200 4
150 4
100+
50
COMPLETED ACTIVE
Compliance Due Total Milestone Compliance
Major Mllestone Date Active* Number Due Date Milestone Description
M-13-00 12/31/2004 2 M-13-00N 06/30/04  |Submit 1 200 NPL RI/FS (RFUCMS) Work Plan For The 200-UR-1
Submit Work Plans for RFI/CMS Y
or RIFS Studies (M-13-000) M-13-000 12/31/04  |Submit 1 200 NPL RUFS (RFVCMS) Work Plan For The 200-SW-1
M-15-00 12/31/2008 12 M-1541C 03/31/04  |Submit Draft 200-TW-1 OU & 200-TW-2 OU FS & Proposed Plan
Site Investigations / (M-15-00) M-15-39B 05/31/04 | Submit Draft A 200-CS-1 Chemical Sewer Group RI Report
Feasibility Studies M-15-43B 06/30/04 | Submit 200-PW-2 OU RI Report Including Past Practice Waste Sites
M-1540C 10/31/04 Submit Draft A 200-CW-5 Pond/Z Ditchas Cooling Water Group FS
M-1546A 1073105 Submit 200 Area Chemical Laboratory Waste OUs RI Report
M-15-39C 11730005  |Submit Draft A 200-CS-1 Chemical Sewer Group FS and Proposed Plan
M-1543C 12/31/05 | Submit 200-PW-2 OU FS and Proposed Plar/Permit Modification
M-15-44A 12/31/05  |Submit 200-MW-1 OU RI Report
M-15468 03/30/06 Submit 200 Area Chemical Laboratory Waste OUs FS
M-15-448 12/31/06 Submit 200MW-1 OU FS and Proposed Plan
M-15-00C 12/31/08 |Complete 200 AreaNon-Tank Farm OU Pre-ROD Site Investigations
M-15-00 12/31/08 _ |Complete RUFS {or RFVCMS) Process for All Operable Units
M-16-00 973072024 3 M-16-66 09/30/04 |Initiate Intermediate Design & Authorization Safety Analysis
Remedial Design / (M-16-00) M-16-67 03731107 Submit Design Report, Schedule, Work Plan for 618-10/11
Remedial Action M-16-00 09730124 _ |Complete Remedial Actions for Al Non-Tank Farm Operable Units
-20- 1273172008 5 M-20-39 11/30/05 | Submit 216-S-10 Pond & Ditch Closure Plan to Ecology
Submit Closure Plans for (M-20-00) M-20-33 12/31/05  |216-A-10/216-A-36B/216-A-37-1 Crib Closure/Post Closure Plans
All RCRA TSD Units (Shared with FH) M-20-54 12/31/08 | Submit 241-CX Tank System Closure/Postclosure Plan
M-20-00B 12/31/08 | Submit 216 & 241 Areas Closure/Post Closure Plans
M-20-00 12/31/08 | Submit Part B Permit Apglications or Closure/RCRA TSD Units
M-23-00 Annually 10 M-24-67A(C) 12/31/03 | DOE Shall Install a Miniimum of 15 Waells by 12/31/03
RCRA Groundwater M-24-578 06/30/04 |DOE Initiates Discussions Annually to Reaffirm Selected Wells
Monitoring M-24-57C 08/01/04 |Conclude Negotiations & Revise M-024-57 by 08/01/04
M-24-57D 12/31/04 |DOE Shall Install a Cumulative of 30 Wells by 12/31/04
M-24-57E 06/30/05 DOE Initiates Discussions Annually to Reaffirm Selected Wells
M-24-57F 08/01/05 Conclude Negotiations & Revise M-024-57 by 08/01/05
M-24-57G 12/31/05 DOE Shall Install a Cumulative of 45 Waells by 12/31/05
M-24-57H 06/30/06 DOE Initiates Discussions Annually to Reaffirm Selected Waells
M-24-57] 08/01/06 Conclude Negotiations & Revise M-024-57 by 08/01/06
M-24-57J 12/31/06 DOE Shall Install a Cumulative of 60 Waells by 12/31/06
M-24-000 T8D Complete Well installations in Accordance with RCRAJCERCLA GW Regs
1 — MILESTONE COMPLETED IN FY04 (C)
TOTAL ACTIVE MILESTONES 32
“Thoude TPA Changes (equEsts Bpprov 7. 2004.

GRP TPA Quarterly Review (01/04 - 03/04)



Attachment 9

CW-1 TIME LINE

ACTIVITY TIME FRAME
Submit FS 11/04
Public Comment Period | 01/05 to 03/05
Start ROD Process 01/05
RL Review | 04/05 to 05/05
Regulatory Review | 06/05 to 08/05

Issue ROD rev 0 09/05

Confirmation Sampling | 01/06 to 09/07
Design 10/06 to 10/07
Remediation 10/07 to 09/20

NOTES




Attachment 10

CW-5 INFORMATION SHEET

Number of OUs 4 (CW-2, CW-4, CW-5 and SC-1)

Number of Waste Sites 48

Location of Waste Sites | 200 East (10) and 200 West (38)

Type of Waste Site Cribs, Ditches, Ponds, Pipelines and Concrete Structures

| Process Waste Types Cooling Water and Steam Condensate

Current CW-5 Time Line

Activity Time Line

FH Internal Draft 06/17

RL Review 08/06 to 08/26

TPA Milestone Draft A to Regulators | 10/31/04

Public Comment Period 02/11/05 to 03/24/05
Start ROD Process 03/25/05

RL Review | 07/19/05 to 08/08/05
Regulatory Review | 09/21/05 to 11/02/05

Issue ROD rev 0 12/09/05

Confirmation Sampling 10/02/06 to 09/05/07
Design 10/02/06 to 09/30/08
‘Remediation 10/01/08 to 09/30/24

NOTES
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Attachment 10

Figure 1-2. Location of the 200-CW-5, 200-CW-2, 200-CW-4, and 200-SC-1 Operable Unit

Waste Sites in the 200 West Area.
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Attachment 10

Figure 1-3. Location of the 200-SC-1 Operable Unit Waste Sites in the 200 East Area.
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