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UNIT MANAGERS' MEETING AGENDA

1200 Jadwin Avenue
April 15, 2004

9am.—-12p.m. 200Area Room 1C1

General (15 minutes)

e Outstanding Action Items

e Open for Regulatory Topics or Action Items
e TPA Quarterly Review

U Plant Area Regional Closure (10 minutes)
e Schedule Review

- FFS/PP Status

- Change Request Status

— Drive casing/Spectra Gamma

- Path forward

BC Cribs Area Closure (10 minutes)
e Schedule Review
— Confirmatory DQO and SAP
- TPA change request to move four LW-1 sites to TW-1

200-TW-1, 200-TW-2, & 200-PW-5 (10 minutes)
e Schedule Review

- Status of Rl Report

~ Status of FS and PP Review

- ROD Strategy

GROUNDWATER OPERABLE UNITS

General (5 minutes)
e Update on Well Decommissioning
— 90 Wells Scheduled For Decommissioning in FY04

200-BP-5 & 200-PO-1 OUs (5 minutes)
e 200-BP-5 Updated Well List
e 200-PO-1 Schedule Status

Attachment 1



Attachment 1

200-UP-1 OU (5 minutes)
e Remediation Treatment Status
e RI/FS Work Plan Status — April 7 Delivery to Ecology
e Will begin drilling New Monitoring Wells “K”, “P”, and “R" Next Week.

200-ZP-1 OU (5 minutes)

e Remediation Treatment Status
e RI/FS Work Plan Status —~ Responding to EPA and RL Comments on Draft A
¢ Replacement Extraction Wells #1 and 4 are being hooked up

SOURCE OPERABLE UNITS

200-PW-1, 200-PW-3, & 200-PW-6 OUs (15 minutes)
e Schedule Review
- Remediation Treatment Status
- Monthly Monitoring
— Status of Field Work Preparation and Planning
- Status of RI/FS Work Plan
— Status of Field Work at 216-Z-9

218-W-4C Burial Ground (5 minutes)
e Remediation Treatment Status

200-CW-1 & 200-CW-3 OUs (10 minutes)
e Schedule Review

- Status of FS and PP

- Spring Sampling Results

— Discussion of GMP Test Area

200-PW-2 & 200-PW-4 OUs (10 minutes)

e Schedule Review
— Status of Waste Management Activities
- Status of Work Plan
- Status of RI Report
— Status of Field Planning for 216-S-7 Borehole
- Status of WCP



200-CS-1 OU (2 minutes)
e Schedule Review
- Status of RI Report

200-CW-5, CW-2, CW-4, & SC-1 OUs (10 minutes)
e Schedule Review

- Status of Work Plan

- Status of Rl Report

— Status of FS

200 Area Ecological Evaluation (10 minutes)
e Schedule Review

- Status of Eco DQO

— Status of Eco Evaluation Report
e Overview of Eco Activities

— Planning for Spring Sampling

200-1S-1 & 200-ST-1 (5 minutes)

e Schedule Review
- Status of Work Plan
- Status of ORP/RL work on pipeline strategy
— Scope Definition

200-LW-1/200-LW-2/200-MW-1 (10 minutes)
— Status of Field Planning
- Status of 200-MW-1 WCP

200-UR-1 (5 minutes)
e Schedule Review
— Status of DQO and Work Plan
— Status of BC Control Zone Planning

200-SW-1/2 (5 minutes)
e Schedule Review
— Status of Work Plan

Attachment 1
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Groundwater and Source Operable Units Unit Managers' Meeting
Official Attendance Record — 200 Area
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Attachment 3

MEETING MINUTES
200 AREA UNIT MANAGERS’ MEETING -- 200 AREA
April 15, 2004

Agenda: See Attachment #1
Attendees: See Attachment #2

Topics of Discussion:

1. General

e OQutstanding Action Items — Maps depicting the central plateau definition were distributed
to the agencies at the meeting. These maps provided a physical outline of the central
plateau and the ecological boundaries. Ecology requested a verbal definition of "central
plateau" be provided as well.

e Open Regulatory Topics or Action Items — DOE/RL stated that Waste Control Plans and
Sampling and Analysis Plans will no longer be signed by DOE. FH, Ecology and EPA
requested a copy of the letter that stated that change in procedure. A DOE representative
will explain this change further at the IAMIT meeting.

e TPA Quarterly Review — Not discussed at the meeting.

2. U Plant Area Regional Closure

e Schedule Review

—  Status of FFS/PP — The Proposed Plan was updated based on recent comments
received. Ecology stated that input will be provided on RCRA/CERCLA integration.
FH is putting together a P3 schedule to show how the plan fits the CERCLA process.
FH will get the Proposed Plan out for another Region 10 review.

— Change Request Status — The TPA Change Request was submitted a month ago and
FH is still waiting for signature.

— Drive Casing/Spectral Gamma — Twenty-nine drive casings have been completed.
Spectral/gamma logs were run in those casings. Ten more casing will be done to try
to gain a better understanding of the spreading under the perimeter of the crib. It
seems the footprint is actually 20% to 30% larger than anticipated. Preliminary work
on design is being performed.

— Path Forward — The goal was to have the ROD out in 2004. That goal is slipping.
The hope is that the Proposed Plan will be out in June or July of 2004. The ROD may
be out in September or October.

3. BC Cribs Area Closure
e Schedule Review

— Confirmatory DQO and SAP — The DQO process continues. A strawman DQO will
be ready by the end of this week. DOE requested more information on the novel
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methods being considered to evaluate the presence of a predicted Tc-99 and nitrate
plume near the 100-ft bgs level.

— TPA Change Request to Move Four LW-1 Sites to TW-1 — The change form has been
transmitted from DOE to Ecology and EPA for signature.

4. 200-TW-1, 200-TW-2, & 200-PW-5

e Schedule Review

— Status of RI Report — Modeling activity to address United States Geological Society
concerns is underway.

— Status of FS and PP Review ~ The review is underway. Meetings with Mike
Goldstein (EPA Lead) are scheduled. The initial focus of these meetings will be on
worker risk, intruder scenarios, and cost estimates.

— ROD Strategy — DOE stated that a final ROD on TW-1/-2/PW-5 is desired.

GROUNDWATER OPERABLE UNITS

5. General

e Update on Well Decommissioning

— 90 Wells Scheduled For Decommissioning in FY 2004 — A handout was distributed
and reviewed (attached).

e 76 Subsurface Work Complete
e 64 All Surface and Subsurface Work Complete

o It was requested that well 299-W26-3, identified as a substitute well for
decommissioning, be added to the 200-UP-1 Interim Action Waste Management
Plan decommissioning well list. The marked-up appendix list will be attached to
these meeting minutes to document this change.

6. 200-BP-S & 200-PO-1 OUs

e 200-BP-5 Updated Well List — Two wells (699-50-53A and 699-53-48B) are dry. They
will be removed from the sampling schedule and from the SAP. EPA stated that they are
not comfortable with work proceeding without DOE signature on the 200-BP-5 Waste
Control Plan. Ecology stated that signatures can and should be obtained at the 200 Area
UMM. EPA doesn't want any sampling going on until the signature issue is resolved.
The issue effects sampling, decommissioning and well drilling. It was stated that FH
cannot work to the previous revision of the Waste Plan.

e 200-PO-1 Schedule Status — Ecology requested a task level schedule in accordance with
TPA from DOE. The schedule was provided during the meeting.

7. 200-UP-1 OU

e Remediation Treatment Status — The average pumping rate for CY04 through April 4 was
47.4 gpm. The system operated at between 49.5 and 55.8 gpm for the month of March
through April 4. The system was shut down for approximately 8 hours on March 4,
2004, for an ERDF leachate transfer. The pump in extraction well 299-W-19-36 failed
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March 22. The pump was replaced and this extraction well was restarted March 26.
Extraction well 299-W19-39 had to be shutdown on March 26 for a few hours due to low
water levels. The system run time for the month of March through April 4 was 99.0%,
for FY 2004 year-to-date was 86.0%, for system inception to date was 92.6%. A handout
was distributed (attached).

RI/FS Work Plan Draft B Status — Ecology comments will be issued April 23.

Will Begin Drilling of New Monitoring Wells “K”, “P”, and “R” Next Week — Drilling
of new monitoring well "P" is scheduled to begin the middle of next week. New
monitoring wells "K" and "R" will follow. Missing data to support the CERCLA RI/FS
process will be collected from these wells.

8. 200-ZP-1 OU

Remediation Treatment Status — The average pumping rate for FY 2004 through April 4
was 120 gpm. For the month of March through April 4, 2004, the system operated at
between 88 and 125 gpm. The system was shut down for approximately two hours on
March 18 for a GAC change out. Extraction well #2 went down March 18 due to a failed
pump. Extraction Wells #1 (W15-33) and #4 (W15-32) were shutdown on March 30 to
transfer components to the replacement wells. Testing of the new replacement extraction
well will begin in approximately one week. The system run time for the month of March
through April 4, 2004, was 99.6%, FY 2004 year-to-date was 93.8% and system '
inception to date was 92.2%. A handout was distributed (attached).

RI/FS Work Plan Status — A review of FH's addressing of EPA comments is scheduled
for April 19.

Replacement Extraction Wells #1 and 4 Are Being Hooked Up — No discussion.

SOURCE OPERABLE UNITS

9. 200-PW-1,200-PW-3, & 200-PW-6 OUs

Schedule Review

— Remediation Treatment Status — The active soil vapor extraction system was restarted
April 1, 2004, at the 216-Z-1A Tile Field. Performance data will be available for
reporting next month. The vapor extraction system will be moved to the 216-Z-9 site
in July. The Unit Managers for the 200-PW-1 OU approved the soil vapor extraction
system operating plan on March 29, 2004 (attached).

— Monthly Monitoring — The anomalously low carbon tetrachloride concentrations
measured at 7 locations during the March 16, 2004, monitoring (reported at the
March 2004 UMM) were found to be caused by sample pump problems. These
locations were resampled on March 24, and the results were reported at this UMM
(attached). Most of the results are consistent with past monitoring. However,
concentrations at two of the sites (CPT-17/10ft and CPT-21A/45ft) that were
resampled are slightly higher than other recent monitoring results at these locations.

— Status of Field Work Preparation and Planning — The 200-PW-1 and 200-PW-3
Waste Control Plans were combined and delivered to DOE and the EPA for review
on April 13, 2004. Comments are requested by the end of the month if possible.

3
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Status of RI/FS Work Plan — The Work Plan is in the signature cycle at DOE-RL for
transmittal to EPA.

Status of Field Work at 216-Z-9 — Drilling at Z-9 has reached a depth of 115 ft and is
into the silt of the Cold Creek Unit. High gamma activity was encountered during
field screening at 112 ft depth; the only gamma emitter detected during the
radiological screening at the laboratory was Am-241. A soil vapor sample collected
in the silt layer (110-112 ft depth) had a relatively high concentration (9,700 ppmv) of
carbon tetrachloride.

10. 218-W-4C Burial Ground

e Remediation Treatment Status — Vapor extraction continues. Carbon tetrachloride

concentration is in the 1 — 5 ppmv range.

11. 200-CW-1 & 200-CW-3 OUs

e Schedule Review

Status of FS and PP — FH is working on migrating the text to a new format.

Spring Sampling Results — Sampling is currently being done. DOE requested that
some of the individuals doing the sampling attend the next 200 Area UMM.

Discussion of GMP Test Area — No discussion regarding Gable Mountain Pond was
held.

12.200-PW-2 & 200-PW-4 OUs

e Schedule Review

Status of Waste Management Activities — Drums from the A-10 waste site went to
ERDF on March 25, 2004. Soil from the 216-A-36B crib is scheduled to go out April
15, 2004. The drill casing is being profiled. FH hopes to have that to ERDF by May
31, 2004.

Status of Work Plan — Ecology stated the review of outstanding items from the
February 23, 2004, comment review meeting will begin next week.

Status of RI Report ~ The DOE review is scheduled to begin May 3, 2004, and run
through May 14, 2004.

Status of Field Planning for 216-S-7 Borehole — Preliminary hazards classification
work has begun. Drilling may begin in August or September 2004.

Status of WCP —~The Waste Control Plan has been updated to add the 216-S-7
borehole.

13.200-CS-1 OU

e Schedule Review

Status of RI Report — DOE should have it out by the end of May 2004.
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14. 200-CW-5, CW-2, CW+4, & SC-1 OUs

e Schedule Review

Status of Work Plan — The Work Plan is in clearance review.

Status of RI Report — DOE requested an over-view of the RI Report when the Rev. 0
version is ready for issuance.

Status of FS — A full draft copy has been received from the sub-contractor and FH is
reviewing that draft. A draft Proposed Plan is being prepared as well.

15. 200 Area Ecological Evaluation

e Schedule Review

Status of Eco DQO — The DQO is being prepared for discussion with the DQO
project participants on May 26th. The draft SAP will be transmitted to the Tri-Party

decision-makers and public participants for their review on
May 4, 2004, as planned.

Status of Eco Evaluation Report — A target date for completion of this report is
May 28, 2004.

e QOverview of Eco Activities

Spring Sampling — The planned reconnaissance surveys were performed in support of
selection of candidate waste sites for ecological sampling. This was a visual
observation of the condition of the waste sites. The results of the reconnaissance
surveys were transmitted to FH on April 29, 2004, as planned. The information is
being reviewed for use in the final version of the SAP.

16. 200-IS-1 & 200-ST-1

e Schedule Review

Status of Work Plan — DOE drafted a transmittal letter to Ecology. An extension
request will need to be made to meet the October deadline.

Status of ORP/RL Work on Pipeline Strategy — Preliminary meetings between FH
and CHG personnel have been held to discuss the logic developed to determine
ownership of the sites. Data gathering to support mapping sites in this OU is
continuing. A FH subcontractor will be tasked to continue mapping sites identified in
other process-based operable units.

Scope Definition — Discussions are ongoing within FH to determine the final scope
and content of the revised work plan. There is some concern over desired document
scope vs. funding available to complete the work.

17.200-LW-1, 200-LW-2, & 200 MW-1
e Status of Field Planning — Field work is anticipated to begin in mid May 2004.

e Status of 200-MW-1 WCP — Awaiting resolution of RL approval concerns.
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18. 200-UR-1

e Schedule Review

Status of DQO and Work Plan — The DQO is complete and being finalized for

issuance. The Decisional Draft of the Work Plan will be delivered to RL for their
review on April 30, 2004.

Status of BC Control Zone Planning — The approach in the Work Plan shows four
groupings of unplanned release sites: candidate sites for rejection through the TPA-
MP-14 process, sites that are candidates for transfer to other remedial actions,
remove-treat-and-dispose sites, and sites that will be evaluated through the full RI/FS
process. The BC Control Area is the only site identified as a candidate for the full
RI/FS process because of it’s unique size and potential for human health and
ecological impacts. This site will also be considered for a treatability study to support
the selection of the remediation alternatives that have the least ecological impact.

19. 200-SW-1/2

e Schedule Review

Status of Work Plan — The DQO process is proceeding. There is a meeting scheduled
for May 6, 2004, to discuss the reclassification of the status in WIDS for selected
waste sites. The global issue, whether 40 CFR 191 is relevant and appropriate as an
ARAR, has not yet been resolved.
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200 Area Unit Managers' Meeting
200 Area Remedial Action Float Table

Attachment 5§

April 2004
Task Scheduled Date Float Comments
200-CS-1
Deliver Draft A Rl Report for Regulator Review 5/31/04 | - On schedule
Deliver Draft A FS/PP for Regulator Review 11/30/05 { -- On schedule
1
200-CW-1
- Regulator comments originally due
7’3’2033 i gue) tda]fe 2 on 5/15/2003; policy level
AR comments received on that date;
regulator comments 45 g &,
Ecology indicated additional
Calendanidad Eer comments would be coming; to date
Deliver Draft B FS for Regulator Review submittal (which would i
. these comments have not been
be 5/15/2003) with 45 ol
. received; the new schedule date
days to revise and pi
relssus) assumes no additional comments
' will be received from the regulators
| on Draft A
9/30/2004 (new target |
date based on
collecting spring B On schedule
samples and
incorporating data into
the revision)
200-LW-1
Deliver Draft A Rl Report for Regulator Review 10/31/05 - On schedule
200-PW-2
Deliver Revised Waste Cpntrol Plan for regulator 3/8/04 _ Delivered 02/23/04
review
After BCR approval, field work is
Ecology approve Rev 1 RIFS work plan 2114103 g, |PPSERISER SRS ERGRRDS SR
of work is forecast to not generate a
variance for the FS.
- - - B _ o ] Assumes RI can be delivered w/o
Deliver Draft A Rl Report for Regulator Review 6/30/04 -- add'l sampling, per Ecology
agreement @ 12/03 UMM
Deliver Draft A FS/PP for Regulator Review 12/31/05 - 2 RS S I WETRANTD
necessary for Ecology request
200-SW-1/200-SW-2
Regulator DQO Interview 4/27/04 -- Interview conducted on 03/17/04
Deliver Draft DQO to regulators 715104 - On schedule
Deliver draft A RI/F:vvi«;c:;k plan for regulator 12/31/04 _ Of sEhednle
_Deliver Waste Control Plan for regulator review 4/15/05 ] -- On schedule
- Start field sampling 7/27/05 = On schedule
Deliver Draft A Ri Report for Regulator Review __9nelor - On schedule 1]
200-TW-1 o ]
. _(includes 200-TW-2) - | | - - _
| Need to finalize path forward on—l
EPA/Ecology approve Rl Report 7/10/03 ‘ -247-d modeling revisions; meeting
— ) o= R —— scheduled for 3/17
Deliver Draft A FS/PP for Regulator Review 3/31/04 . = Delivered on 03/31/04 i
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200 Area Remedial Action Float Table

April 2004
Task Scheduled Date Float Comments
200-UR-1
Deliver draft A Rllliiv\;;%;k plan for regulator 6/30/04 _ B Echedile
Deliver Waste Control Plan for regulator review ~ 3/1/06 P L (- “On schedule
Start field sampling 4/26/06 - On schedule
Deliver Draft A Rl Report for Regulator Review 5M14/07 | - On schedule

U Plant Waste Sites

Remedial decisions were not
reached with Ecology and EPA as
Ecology approve confirmatory sampling SAP 12/1/03 -110-d planned. General consensus has
just been developed and the SAP is

being finalized.

Defered until FY05 due to budget

Start U Plant Confirmatory and Design Sampling 1/5/04 -- ;
constraints
Deliver Draft A RD/RA work plan for regulator
review (surface barrier RD/RA) L F__1’18/05 - O e e .
Deliver Draft A RD/RA work plan for regulator 118105 _ Onsctetule

review (excavation RD/RA)

200-1S-1/200-ST-1

On schedule with current
understanding of work scope. |f

Deliver Rev. 1 RI/FS work plan 10/29/04
scope of work expands, then
schedule will require reevaluation.
Deliver Waste Control Plan for regulator review 1/24/05 -- On schedule

200-PW-1/200-PW-3/200-PW-6

Deliver Rev. 0 RI/FS work plan 3/31/04 - Delivered to RL on 3/8
Draft passed out on 03/18/04. EPA
Deliver PW-3 Waste Control Plan for regulator 3/29/04 _ requested the WCP for PW-3 and
review PW-1 be combined. New delivery

date 04/14/04 i
Draft passed out on 03/18/04. EPA
Deliver revised PW-1 Waste Control Plan for 3/29/04 _ requested the WCP for PW-3 and
regulator review PW-1 be combined. New delivery

date 04/14/04

200-MW-1
Deliver Waste Control Plan for regulator review 3/26/03 - Delivered 03/23/04

Deliver Draft A RI Report for Regulator Review 12/31/05 -~ On schedule
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200 Area Remedial Action Float Table

April 2004
Task Scheduled Date Float Comments
200-CW-5/200-CW-2/200-CW-4/200-SC-1 |
Consolidation TPA change package
approved 6/5/2002; currently
planned for 3/31/2004. Revision
was delayed pending receipt of
| Ecology input on ecological
M-013-22 met on evaluation, which was received on
| schedule; Rev. 0 work 11/18/03. This was followed by a
plan approved final review with EPA 12/3/03.
9/28/2002. There were several additional
) Consolidation TPA delays, including: EPA's request to
DRAVEFNaR: LTS wedy Plah change package g reinstate the SAP as part of the
. approved 6/5/2002. Work Plan (previously issued
Rev. 1 originally separately to enable field
scheduled to be characterization to proceed); Official
delivered 5/6/2003 Use Only (OUO) document driven

revisions; and poor figure quality
problems associated with the XP-
Pro Operating System. Document
| currently being review by DOE. New
delivery date 04/21/04

9/1/2003 (original date
based on receipt of
regulator comments on
7/15/2003 with 45 days
for revision)

Currently scheduled for 4/30/2004.
Because the consolidation logic is
-229-d provided in the work plan, it was
agreed that work plan issuance
would precede the RI report.

Deliver Rev. O Rl Report

__Deliver Draft A FS/PP for Regulator Review 10/31/04 - On schedule
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200 Area UMM — April 2004

200-UP-1:

e Average Pumping Rate (counting all outage time as 0 gpm) for CY04
through April 4: 47.4 gpm.

e For the month of March through April 4, the system operated between
49.5 and 55.8 gpm.

e System was shutdown for approximately 8 hours on March 4 for an ERDF
leachate transfer.

e The pump in extraction well 299-W19-36 failed March 22. The pump was
replaced and this extraction well was restarted March 26.

e Extraction well 299-W19-39 had to be shutdown on March 26 for a few
hours due to low water levels (pumping too hard).

e System Run Time

e For Month of March through April 4 99.0%
e FY2004 (Year to date) 86.0%
e System Inception to date 92.6%

e RI/FS Work Plan Draft B — Ecology Comments will be issued April 23

o Important Mitestenes™ DelLtws~Ldon P2 \X0S Jor 2)3/es
> July 12, 2005 —S26546+68, DOE-RL submit@%aft A RI Report to Regulators
> April 5, 2007 — 82054160, Issue Draft A FS Report to Regulators

¢ Drilling of new monitoring well “P” is scheduled to begin the middle of next
week. New monitoring wells “K” and “R” will follow. Missing data to
support the CERCLA RI/FS process will be collected from these wells.

200-ZP-1:

e Average Pumping Rate for FY04 through April 4: 120 gpm

e For the month of March through April 4, the system operated at between
88 and 125 gpm.

e System was shutdown for approximately 2 hours on March 18 for a GAC
changeout.

e On March 18 Extraction Well #2 went down due to a failed pump.

e Extraction Wells #1 (W15-33) and #4 (W15-32) were shutdown on March
30 to transfer components to the replacement wells.

¢ We will begin testing the new replacement extraction well in
approximately one week.

e System Run Time

e For Month of March through-April 4 99.8%
e FY2004 (Yearto date) 93.8%
e System Inception to date 92.2%

e RI/FS Work Plan Status — Will be reviewing how we plan to address EPA
comments with Dennis Faulk April 19.
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200-PW-1 (200-ZP-2):
e Active system was restarted April 1, 2004. | will have performance data to
report next month.
e The passive system remains operational.
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200-UP-1 Average Pumping Rate for FY2004
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200-ZP-1 Average Pumping Rate for FY2004
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Comparison of Maximum Carbon Tetrachioride Rebound Concentrations
Monitored at 200-PW-1 Soil Vapor Extraction Sites

FY 1998 - FY 2004

Attachment 7

July 2002 (Z-9) or October
200-PW-1 October 1997 - July 1998 - July 1999 - July2001 - July2002 - 2003 (Z1A) -
(200-ZP-2) September 1998 S 1999 June 2001 June 2002 September 2003 March 2004

Localion Site | Maximum Rebound | months®| Maximum Rebound | months*] Maximum Rebound | months®| Maxmum Rebound | months®| Maxmum Rebound | months®] Maxmum Rebound | months
{Well or Probe) Carbon Tetrachloride of Carbon Tekachloride of Carbon Tetrachloride| of Carbon Tetrachioride of Carbon Tetrachloride of Carbon Tetrachioride of
/teet bgs {ppmv) rebound (ppmv) rebound (ppMv) rebound| (ppmv) rebound (ppmv) rebound| (ppmv) rebound
79-00/ 5 Z-18 ofF -3 o 1
79-06/5 ft 2-1A not measured 1.4 9
79-11/5R Z1A 0 6 29 1
86-05/5ft 2-9 not measured 0 J)
86-05-01/5ft 29 not measured 0 3
IB&OGI ft 29 0 9 1.9 6
87-05/5ft 21A 0 3 10 12
[67-0a/5 1 Z4A 15| 3 26| 12
94-02/5 ft 29 not measured 14 53
95-11/51 29 21 9 2.5 €
95-12/5 ft 29 15 9 13 €
[95-14/5 1t 2.9 not measured 0
CPT-13A/9 ft Z-1A 0 (] 1.0 12
CPT-16/ 10 ft 2-9 0 S 15 6
CPT-17/10 ft 29 42 S 5.1 6 6.6 24 32 6 66 15 9.0 21
ICPT-1&/ 15 ft 29 6.5 9 50 6 5.2 24 14 6 24 15 24 21
ICPT-4A/ 251t Z1A not measured not measured| 35 0 34/ 10
CPT-4E/251 21A not measured not measured| not measured]| 26| 12 13] o0
CPT-16/25 ft Z2-9 not measured| not msasu'ed| 18] 24 1.1 8 2 15 26| 21
CPT-31725 ft Z-1A o 6 o 12 1 |
CPT-32/ 251 Z-1A 9.1 6 10 12 16.5| 18 13.0] 1 8.3 6 6|
CPT-30/ 28 ft Z-18 not measured 32| 12 14 18 0 1 0 6 0
CPT-13A/30ft Z-1A not measured not measured; 3.6 18 26 1 € 6 2
CPT-7A/ 32 ft Z1A 23 (] 54 12 62 18 5.6 1 3 6 9.5
CPT-27/33 ft 2.9 not measured| not measured| 26| 24 1.5 8 15 271 2
CPT-1A/35 1t 2-12 14 3 3.0 12 7.7 18 11.3] 12 220 15 18.3.
ICPT-28/40 ft 29 56.5 (]
CPT-33/40 ft Z1A 20 3 26 12 23 12
CPT-34/40 ft 2-18 not measured 1.7] 12 1.9 0 22 12 16 0
CPT-21A/ 45 ft 2. 527 9 57 127 24 133 (] 90.0 15 150.0 21
IW15-220ST/52ft | 2- not measured 1.8 25 24 15 1
ICPT-28/60 ft 2Z- 15] 0 37
CPT-9A/ 60 ft 2-9 41.1 0 44| 68 24 453 6 359 15 35.9] 21
CPT-16/ 65 ft 2-9 not measured not measured not measured-l not measured 42 15
CPT-1A/ 68 ft Z-12 not measured not measured not measured| 5,5| 12
ICPT-30/68 ft Z2-18 not measured 30 12
CPT-32/701t Z1A 7.7 12
CPT-137/ 701 -1A not measured| 12
CPT-2470 ft Z-9 32 ] 3. 3 4.7 15
W15-219SST/ 70 fff Z2-9 not measured| 3 7.8 24 19 1
CPT-1&/75 ft Z-9 not measured[ not measured 1EI 24 4 .'zl 15
CPT-4A/ 751t Z-1A not measured not measured not measured 7.3 3
CPT-31/76 ft Z-1A not measured 4 12
CPT-33/80 1t Z-1A not measure: 9. 12
W15-82/ 83 ft Z-9 5. 9 46 6 55 24 68.7 6 858| 15 85.8 21
CPT-21A/86 ft 2-9 20€ 9 14 6 195 24 188 6 206 15 244 21
CPT-34/88 ft 2-18 5. 3 0 12
W15-95U/ 86 ft 29 15. 9 39 € 43 21
W15-218SST/ 868 W 2-S not measured; 0 1.6 2
(CPT-28&/ 87 Z-S 230] o 203 224] 24 229 6 23515 —258] 21
CPT-4B/ 90 ft ZA1A 3.2 10
CPT-1A/91 1t 2-18 not measured 42 12 10.7 10
PT-4A/91 ft Z-1A 7 &4 3 14 12 75 2
CPT-9A/ 91 ft 29 345 S 72 ] 743 8
W15-85/91 Z-9 not measured not measured| 51 24
W18-252SST/ 100 | Z-1A 17.81 3 24] 12
jwis-157 101 | 212 1.1 3 33] 12 25] 18 257] 12 207] 6 124] 6
CPT-4E/ 103 ft Z-1A not measured[ not msasuredi not measured| 16.1 12
W18-167/ 106 ft Z-1A 79.7 3 228] 12 248] 18 297 12 243 6 266] 6
W18-165/ 109 ft Z-1A not measured: not measured! not measured| 278 12 328 6 ;oﬁ 6
W15-217/ 114 ft Z-9 630 S 581 L] 442] 24 936| 6 444 15 458, 21
CPT-24/ 118 ft 29 377 S 37 &} 35| 24 278 15
W15-220SST/ 118] 2-9 not measured 38 3 Al 24 27.5) 3
W18-158U 120t | Z2-1A 143 2 492 12 284 18 163 3
W15-219SST/ 130| 2-9 not measured| 47 3 54 24 23.
W18-249/ 130 ft Z-18 204 3 215 12 176 18 196 12 46.3 € 41.0 6
W18-248/ 131 ft Z-1A 88.3 3 177 12 214 18 306 12 182 8 180
W15-95U 144 ft 2. not measured not measured not measured 31.8 6 25. 15 403] 21
W15-219SST/ 155] 2- not measured 24 3 44| 24 68l 1
W15-220U 163 Rt | Z- —] 15
W15-219U 175 2- — 15
W15-9U 176 ft 2-9 15.0 9 15 & 20 21 16.9 8 13.1 15 131 21
W15-84U 180 ft 29 not measured not measured| not measured not measured 259] 15 259] 21
W1S-6U 182 ft 2-9 178] 9 13] 6
W15-220SST/ 185 29 not measured| 13 3 15 24 e 1
W18-7/ 197 ft Z-1A 17.3 3 29 12 =
W18-12/ 198 ft 2-18 3.81 3 19 12
W18-6U/ 208 ft Z-1A 31.3 6 15 12
| — e, | S g o '
onts may be beyond SVE zone of nfluenco duing partiular dperatig configurations ! |
B — ! |
l

- CPT-1A, CPT-9A, and possiVE zone of i

1
2 in Oct 96 based on dlﬂeunﬂal presule _(BHI 01105 P 6«1)

- CPT-9A, CPT- 21A, CPT- -28 96 based on CCl4 concentrations and airflow modeling based on measured vacuums {BHI-01105 p 6-1)

4




Carbon Tetrachloride Rebound Concentrations
Monitored at 200-PW-1 Soil Vapor Extraction Sites
July 2002 (2-9) or October 2003 (Z2-1A) - March 2004

Attachment 7

200-PW-1 E— o il e S [ ] | ] | L | —— —— 2 Ir————

®00-2P-2) 1 07/30r2002 | 08/26/2002 | 10042002 10/30/2002 | 11/27/20024[_12/3112002&1/:0700? 02/21/2003 | 0342072003 | 05/01/2003 | 05/22/2003 | 07/01/2003 | 08/05/2003 | 08/26:2003 | 10/31/2003 | 121042003 12222003 | 01}20/2'00471}_02119&’004[0&10!27004 | 0372412004
Lo P | ' ¥ | | ] \ 4 = ! Iy e 3 fi=— 1

(Wel or Probe) | | ccu ccHu CcCh CCM | CCM | CCu | CCM_| CCH cCu | ccs | ccu | CCw | ccw | com 1 ccu ccw T com 7 cew ! C
I Neet (pomv) w) v) v) 1) ™) nv) {pomv) (pomv) V] ___(comy) v omy) " (pt "’_ —
CPT-17/10 N Z 16 1.4 2.0 1.8 1.1 1.0 1.3 — 15 EX] 53 6.6 6. 2 32 4 27 50 - (e 9.0
cPT-18/15 1 FZ 0 [ 1.2 0 [} 0 0 17 of 20] 18 2.4 of X} 1.0 14— 1
CPT-16/25 1 2- [ [ [ 0 [ [ [ 0 1.0 0 1.5 . 28] 1. 1.4 1.7 22
CPT-32/ 251 FZTY I ol 5.1 59 5
[cPT-30/28 1t 1 2Z-1A [ ol ol I‘+_~ )
CPT-13W30R | Z-1A| [ J I o of 0 8
CPT-TAI 320 [ Z4A| i ! : | | ! Y i ' = i 24/ 3.0 21 s _3.g+ Ty _%3;
CPTZIT 33 N f Z9. o 0 0 I 0, o o, [ 1o 170 T4t o 1.8 11 P G F) D— 7 " 2 S—
CPT-1A/ 35 212 ’ | i i | i — ] 18.3] 95 134 106 6.0, 9.0
CPT-21A/ 45 L 29 60.2, 316 68.0 61. 35.7, 40.8; 45.. 304 73.7 72.8 90,0/ 75.1 as.s" 83.0, 523 8.1 68.5, §9.2| 71.8 —-(@© 15(1
CPT-9A/ 60 f Z-9 35.1 8.4 278 22. 12.5 74 14, 13.8 35.9] 30.1 33.2] 30.1 30.0 285 25.9] 33.1 30.8 243 338 211
W15-82/ 83 o z9 85.8 5.6 58.8 35, 14.7 121 6. 15.4 36.0 50.0 56.2 49.2 443 54.4 24.0| U4 [EX] 47.5| 45.9 0.5
CPT-21A/ 86 ft Z-9 159 5 155 95.0 55.3 464 66.9 446 140 199 206 153 187 197 918 183 7 244 98.1 - (c) 212
CPT-20/87 1t 29 208 54.2 169 130 516 48.8 203 876 139, 178 235 150 197! 190! 158| 208 140, 6.7/ 96.1 - 258
W18-1527101 0 | Z-12 5.7 105 11.3] 10.5] 124] |2.1l
W18-1677108 | Z-1A 20 223 201 268 201 = (B
Wistes 1R Z1A - 208 BT Y
W1S-217/114 29 . 821 340 214 387,  80.0! 287 743 409 89.7 335; 444 .4 82.0 - (¢ 458
wis2491300 28, | _ [ [T B L . 221 410, s
W18.24811318 | Z1A " . ! = 4 i 1 ) 1 | 0.4 166 180! =
W1S-95U 144 2.9 13_.,31. o 1.1 8.8 97 19 Ta7 72, d 251 137, —109] 2023 403 23.0
wiseU 176 n L 29 esS— SN 28 52 S8 5.1 105 82 L 103 12.1] 25 S, 91| 9.6; .
W15-84Ls Y600 ' 29 | 58 13.1 28 72! 106i B 109! 188 83 28, 1700 210 230 4.9 18.5' — (D) 19.
(8) Unable to access because of drilling operations | J ! i S [ S
(b) ubing wi i R | ; }
|




Carbon Tetrachloride Concentrations
Monitored at 200-PW-1 Passive Soil Vapor Extraction Wells

Attachment 7

200-PW-1 !
(200-ZP-2) 6/1/2001 | 12/10/2002 | 01/20/2003 | 03/04/2003 | 05/07/2003 | 09/09/2003 | 10/29/2003 | 02/25/2004 | 04/12/2004
Location Site | Zone
(Well or Probe) CCl4 CCl4 CCl4 CCl4 CCl4 CCl4 CCl4 CCl4 CCl4
/feet bgs (Ppmv) (ppmv) (ppmv) (pPmv) (ppmv) (pPmv) (Ppmv) (ppmv) (ppmv)
W18-6L/ 208 ft Z-1A| 6 47.4 29.2 19.6 34.8 20.2 ——(a) 22.1 23.4 238
W18-7/ 197 ft Z-1A| 6 385 36.8 28.9 26.4 23.0 —-(a) 23.7 18.6 35.9
W18-10L/ 183 ft Z-18| 6 12.8 14.7 11.1 15.1 25 25 9.1 10.1 96
W18-11LJ 199 ft Z-18| 6 11.4 7.7 ——(a) 9.9 —-(a)  — (a) —(a)] = (@) - (a)
W18-12/ 198 ft Z18| 6 30.5 — (@) - (a) —-(a) 7.9 5.4 13.4 13.0 11.4
W18-246L/170ft  [Z18| 6 | 409 - (@) 31.1 33.1 10.3] - (a) 203 294 47.7
W18-247L/167ft | Z-18| 6 L) 5.7 85 81 2.4 24 24 43 46
W18-252L/175ft | z-18| 6 | 381 Doull = (a) 244 23.1 —- (a) 16.2 377 2.7
(a) Unable to sample. |




Attachment 8
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Attachment 9
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Attachment 10

DOE/RL-2000-51

Rev. 4
APPENDIX A
200-UP-1 GROUNDWATER WELL LIST

299-W14-56 299-W19-29 209-W22-37 699-36-70A
299-W14-57 299-W19-30 299-W22-38 699-38-65
299-W14-58 299-W19-31 299-W22-40 699-38-68A
299-W15-37 299-W19-32 299-W22-45 699-38-70
299-W18-15 299-W19-34A 299-W22-46 699-40-62
299-W18-19 299-W19-35 299-W22-48 New well K*
299-W18-20 299-W19-36 209-W22-49 New well L®
299-W18-21 299-W19-37 299-W22-60 New well M?
299-W18-29 299-W19-38 299-W22-74 New well N°
299-W18-30 299-W19-39 299-W23-4 New well O°
299-W18-33 299-W19-40 299-W23-8 New well P®
299-W18-250 299-W19-43 299-W23-9 New well Q°

299-W19-1 299-W19-46 299-W23-10 New well R®

299-W19-4 299-W19-90 299-W23-14 New well S°

299-W19-5 299-W19-91 299-W23-15

299-W19-7 299-W19-92 299-W23-16

299-W19-9 299-W19-93 299-W23-17

299-W19-14 299-W21-1 299-W23-19

299-W19-19 299-W22-4 299-W26-12

299-W19-20 299-W22-8 200W26-13, o0 63 acaes ab
299-W19-23 299-W22-9 699-32-62 A\S-cA UMM
299-W19-24 299-W22-20 699-32-72A

299-W19-25 299-W22-22 699-35-66A

299-W19-26 299-W22-23 699-35-70

299-W19-27 299-W22-26 699-35-78A

299-W19-28 299-W22-28 699-36-61A

* New monitoring well specified in DOE/RL-2002-10, Rev. 0

Interim Action Waste Management Plan for the 200-UP-1 Operable Unit
May 2003 Distr-1



Attachment 11

- Groundwatler Remediaimﬁ PEH/F S ROD’s Fagefof i

‘GROUNDWA
REMEDIATION PROJECT‘ Updated March 23, 2004 02:10 PM
07 Uy 2010 11 | ALK 2014
rt [NoviDecldn' Febl Mﬂ A" Ve &n | M JAD] Sep ON DL LMJAM JIJTATS O N D JIF 'M A'_M_I JAISIOND JFMAMIA SO NIUJFMAM]JASplN_DlJlFMAﬂ]JASQNDJ]FMAIMJJ‘AISQN DJFMA MEJAISDNDI FMAMIJA S DINDJF MAMTJAISON D JFMANJJAS
100 Area Groundwatbr Operable Units Proposed
100-BC-5 A DQO for RI/FS Process A\ Risk Assessment A Fea ib lity Stu@ [\Plan‘{ ROD A
116-K-2 Source Remediation M-016-53
100-KR-4 i oo Final 100-KR4
Prepare DQO Supporting  Data Collection o Support Risk  Prepare K sk Feasibility Study / Ina
a sfor RI/FS Process  Risk Assessment Assement Mssessnbent Report  Proposed Plan A ’OU GWROD
100-NR-2 Ecological Scoping DOO iamp“n%Evaluation and Report @ AM'OIG'SS
2.31-2012
Sﬂing Sampkg Prepare DQO Supporting  Data Collection tp Support Risk  Prepare |k sk Feasibility Study/ Fi;ca):)]OO-NR-Z
for RI/FS Process  Risk Assessment  Assemeny VAssessnik nt Repori  Proposed Plan A ’
Laboratory Testing for S-90 Treatment - Phyto
MField Test of Selected Treatmen
A Laboratory Testing for S-90 Treatment - Apatite
100-HR-3 DQO Suppoftihg Risk Data Collection o Support prepa re Risk Feasibility Study, hﬁ:f‘;so] N:g]] S:Z
Prepare for RI/FS Process Ricl g Mssessment Repod Proposed Plan A 191201 ’ﬁnal 100- HRtl OU GW ROD
If Met, PreP{e to Tum-Off
H-Area Monitor Wells Approaching RAO's Evaluate Meeting RAO's H Treatment
D-Area Plan ISRM Fxtensjon A Implement ISRM Extension A Nmplemegy ISRM Extension
Proposed
]00-FR-3 ANNA for RIFS Pro ess/\Feasibility Stt y APlan A R(D A
200 Areg Groundwater Operable Units
200-UP- &Remednal Investigation ﬁ Rl Lieport/Risk Assessment e A Feas,bi,ity Study L & , Proposed Plan ‘FA
T L I T
200-ZP-1 4 DQO/Work Plan to Support RI/FS A Remedial Investithion 4 RIReport/ Ls Assessment EFeasibiliJV Study / Proposed lang,
&termedlate & Deep CCL, Vadose Zo% Investigation 1“
DNAPL Investigation at 216-Z-9
p CCL, Transport Modeling
DQO for RFI/CMS Propo ed
200-BP-5 A\Process A Feasibility Stud A Plan A TBD
DQO for s@ Proposed
200_PO_] ARF[/CMS Proc easibility Stud Treat: bility Studv—/\ Plah A TBD
300 Area Groundwater Operable Units oo for
©)
300-FF-5 RPNOMS Pracadd Focused Feasibility Study, Pha e /\ PPrbposed
an
@ Foku ed Feasibility ~ Draft
/\Treatabilitv Testir Nshdy, phase 2
Acronyms I@S"}\es- - ted deadi TPA Milestones Legend
Da . Lo . . ssumes renegotiated deadline . Active
EVQVO G?::u?\::the? Objectives PNNL - Pac,ﬁc North.wes.t National Laboratory for ROD ecological study M-01647 Complete Interim Remedial Actions for 100D Area 12/31/2011 .
LF1 - Limited Field Investizati Rl - Remedial Investigation ‘bilit Stud |® Assumes Limited Field Investigation done M-016-51 Complete Interim Remedial Actions for 100H Area 12/31/2010 A\ Key Event(Start/Completion)
. "8' ed Fie "Vss 1gation RIFS - Remedial |nVC'St.lgatl°n/F€35| ility Study previously, supplied adequate data. M-016-53 Complete Interim Remedial Actions for 100K Area  12/31/2012 — Activity / Task
perations and Maintenance  ROD - Record Of Decision ' If Required. M-016-55 Complete Interim Remedial Actions for 100N Area 12/31/2012 ATi Party Agreement Milestone
_OU - Operable Ui _SAP - Sample & Analysis Plan_ BCRI
) L el == CRin progress S i Ca—e NI e I I




